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The Citizens Bank clock on Hwy. 150 in Mt. Vernon showed a reading of zero last Thurs-
day morning, around 7:40 a.m. However, a low temperature of minus three was recorded
later that morning at the Cox Funeral Home Weather Station in Mt. Vernon. The minus
three degrees was followed by a minus two last Friday. The below zero temperatures were
the lowest recorded in the county in the past two years. Wednesday morning when school
was called for the third straight day, the temperature dropped to three degrees above zero.
(Photo by: Richard Anderkin).

A new fire truck was delivered to the City of Mt. Vernon last Friday afternoon by Bob Burns, President of Vehicle Systems of Lexington. The Mt. Vernon
City Council voted to buy the 2008 four door Freightliner at their December meeting at a cost of $217,467. On hand to take delivery of the new city truck
were from left: firemen Chris Kerns, Adam Bales, Jackie Wayne Weaver, asst. Fire Chief Jack Weaver, Burns, Mt. Vernon Mayor Clarice Kirby, Fire Chief
David Bales, Brian Bullock, David Derr, Darrell Smith, Jeff Parker, Brandon Reynolds, Josh Hayes, Jordan Bales and Dallas Todd. In front is Keaton
McClure, Jack Weaver’s grandson. The new truck should be fully operational in the next week to ten days. (Photo by: Richard Anderkin)

Carlos Ray Cunningham, 30, of Mt. Vernon died Friday in the above head-on crash in Garrard County. (Photo by: Danny
Elam, Garrard Central Record)

In Garrard County last Friday

Local man dies in head-on crash

No school
Wednesday

Rockcastle County school
students got another unsched-
uled day off on Wednesday,
when school was dismissed
again because of slick roads.

Wednesday’s dismissal was
only the fourth time school has
been dismissed this school year
because of bad weather, but it
was the third straight school
day classes had to be cancelled,
starting with last Friday.

Many side roads in the
county were still slick on
Wednesday because of a small
Monday night snowfall and
because of the fact that there
was little sunshine on Tuesday
when the high temperature
reached only 27 degrees.

The recorded low tempera-
ture on Wednesday morning
was three degrees above zero.

With Wednesday’s closing
the last day for students this
school year is now scheduled
for Friday, May 21st.

Special to the Signal
By Pattie Cox

Garrard Central Record
A horrific head-on collision,

caused by a suspected drunken
driver, on one of the coldest
days of the season took the
lives of both drivers  last Fri-
day afternoon in Garrard
County.

Carlos Cunningham, 30,  of
Mt. Vernon,  died immediately
from massive head trauma,
while the victim, Brandon
Plummer, 21, Lancaster, died

early the next morning during
surgery to repair internal inju-
ries.

Plummer was airlifted to
Lexington after the accident
and all indications were that he
would be okay, his mother
Carol Plummer said on Tues-
day. Doctors even came out
about mid-way through surgery
to tell family members that he
was doing well and that the car-
diac team was in the process of
preparing him for open-heart
surgery.  They thought they

would be repairing a bulge in
his aorta. But what they found
was worse, in fact so bad that
they didn’t understand how he
had lived as long as he had.
Two tears in the body’s largest
artery were discovered.

Lancaster City officers Will
Lake and Tim Royce re-
sponded to the call from dis-
patch asking for any agency to
respond to complaints about a
suspected impaired driver who
was all over Crab Orchard
Road. One woman even made

the statement that the man
needed to be taken off the road
before he killed somebody, po-
lice said.

Cunningham at one point
had pulled into a driveway just
west of Steve Crawley’s weld-
ing shop on Crab Orchard
Road. As Lake drove by he saw
the vehicle but was not sure
that it was the suspect until
Royce radioed that a driver
stopped him to tell him that it
was Cunningham.

Lake turned around and
drove by the parked vehicle
again and met up with Royce.
Both police cars drove east
again and as they approached,
Cunningham backed out and
drove around Lake first and
then Royce who were both at-
tempting to block him in. He
sped off in the direction of Fall

Lady Rockets ranked
number two in state

The Rockcastle County
High School Lady Rockets
were ranked second in the state
on Monday in the Lexington
Herald-Leader’s Dave Cantrell
Ratings, which is the highest

One person was arrested af-
ter Rockcastle County sheriff’s
deputies discovered a working
methamphetamine lab at a
home in northern Rockcastle
County late last Wednesday
night.

According to a news release,
at approximately 10:30 p.m.
Deputies Jason Kirby, Ronnie
Bradley and Roger Pigg were
investigating a complaint about
a possible meth lab on property
off Lil’ Clear Creek Road in the
Conway community.

The deputies received per-
mission from the landowner to
search a house, which was re-
portedly being used just for
storage.

At the house police found
29-year-old Coleman Gibbs, of
Burchwood Drive, Berea,

Arrest made after
Meth Lab found

Rocket Docket shows
Fiscal Court first results

Assistant Commonwealth
Attorney Jeremy Bartley was at
last Wednesday’s regular meet-
ing of the Rockcastle Fiscal
Court to report on the recently
instituted Rocket Docket  pro-
gram.

Bartley told the court that
three offenders, Amanda Kates

Bullens, 28, Michael Wombles,
29 and Travis Deborde, 22 had
all taken advantage of the new
program. He said that, under
normal circumstances, the
county would have had to
house the three for a combined

Fiscal Court
sets Peters’
and Houk’s
2009 budgets

During a special called
meeting last Friday, the fiscal
court heard a request from
Sheriff Mike Peters for the
county to fund an additional
deputy for his office and re-
duced the salary cap for County
Clerk Norma Houk’s office.

Peters told the court that his
office needed another road
deputy to better serve the
county’s safety needs but that
his present revenue could not
support an additional $30,000
cost.

Peters said that presently he
was having to pay substantial
overtime and the county was
still without a officer on duty
from 4 a.m. to 8 a.m. And, Pe-
ters added, there is not a state

along with the active meth lab
and other items related to meth-
amphetamine production.

Gibbs was charged by the
Rockcastle County Sheriff’s
Office on outstanding warrants.

Operation UNITE detec-
tives were notified about the
discovery and charged Gibbs
with one count of manufactur-
ing methamphetamine.

He was lodged in the
Rockcastle County Jail under
a $25,000 cash/property bond
and was arraigned in
Rockcastle District Court on
Wednesday.

UNITE  officers were at the
home for several hours assist-
ing with cleanup efforts.

An investigation continues

rating for the team since 2005,
when they were also ranked
second.

The Lady Rockets were also
ranked number one in the 12th
region, on Monday followed
by Casey County and Lincoln
County.

Casey County is ranked
10th in the state and Lincoln
County 13th.

After Tuesday night’s  51-
36 win over visiting Wayne
County the Lady Rockets are
15-4, but two of those losses
have been to Casey County and
Lincoln County.

Head Coach Chrysti Noble,
who is in her 18th season as
head coach of the Lady Rock-
ets, said Tuesday that while she
appreciates the high ranking,
she doesn’t put much stock in
them.

“Although we lost to Lin-
coln County early and we
played terrible at Casey when
we lost, we still lost to both of
them and we are ranked higher
than they are in that poll, it just
doesn’t make a lot of sense,”
Noble said.

“The only thing that matters
is if we continue to get better
down the stretch and are ready
for the district and. hopefully,

trooper from 2 a.m. to 8 a.m.
on duty in the county. The sher-
iff also pointed out that last
year, his office answered 5,800
911 calls not counting calls to
his office and cell phone. Pe-
ters said he felt it would take a
minimum of five deputies, and
maybe six, to provide adequate
service to the county.

County Judge/Executive
Buzz Carloftis told the court
that Rockcastle is now supple-
menting the sheriff’s office
over $115,000 a year -- includ-
ing matching social security
and retirement benefits but that
other counties, of comparable
population, to Rockcastle, are

(Cont. to A12)

(Cont. to A12)

(Cont. to A12)

(Cont. to A12)

(Cont. to A12)
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Editor’s
Notes

By Richard Anderkin

(Cont. to A3)

When you take a moment
and think about how some
people in the United States
have treated African Ameri-
cans, during our 230 year his-
tory, who cannot help but feel
good about Tuesday’s swear-
ing in of President Barack
Obama.

Shortly after the President
took the oath of office on Tues-
day, I was in the courthouse
gathering information on other
subjects and of course the
day’s events became the topic
of discussion.

I’m not totally sure, but I
think I was talking to most, if
not all, Republicans, who had
not voted for the 44th President
in November.

But, there were no racial re-
marks, no forecasts of dooms-
day --  only comments of  sup-
port and hope for a better
United States, from people
who are Americans before they
are Republicans.

I, myself,  am cautiously
optimistic about the future of
this country and I hope that the
politics in our nation’s Capitol
do not  hinder the apparent
good intentions of the free
world’s new leader.

Few are willing to accept
the responsibility that goes
with being put in a place of
leadership, and, if the present
conditions in this country
prove anything, it is apparent
that even fewer are good at it.

President Obama likely

will be good at fullfilling the
duties of his office, but I can-
not help but think that our Con-
gressional leaders, who can be
elected for life, are more to
blame for what has happened
in this country, than any of the
past few Presidents and they
may, in the end, hinder his at-
tempts to lead this country in
the right direction.

We elect a President every
four years and after eight -- if
that President has been re-
elected -- we send them home.

That isn’t the case with
Congress. If they can raise
enough money, take care of the
right people in the right places
and don’t get caught in a sex
scandal, they are in Washing-
ton until they either decide
they have sucked at the public
tit until their mouth is sore or
they die in office. Either way,
you’ve got senators and repre-
sentatives who have lasted
through five Presidents and
who, in many cases, are far re-
moved from the problems that
face ordinary Americans.

Let’s all give President
Obama a chance, after all we
keep giving the rest of our law-
makers chance after chance.
That is what this country is all
about, chances to do good.

Here is wishing our new
President the best. We all know
he will need whatever support
the common person can give
him.

Points East
By Ike Adams

I’m not good at keeping
records or track of things.

Loretta has a folder in her
filing system wherein anything
I purchase that might be tax
deductible, I throw in a receipt
from time to time. I do try to
stay on top of that because I am
not fond of paying taxes that I
don’t owe. Nor am I fond of
paying the taxes the system
says I do owe.

It is, at least .interesting to
me, that our country was
founded and the American
Revolution was fought back
there in the 1770’s because  the
colonists didn’t want to pay
taxes. Then the first thing that
our Great Uncle George did
when the war was over was slap
a tax on whiskey because a tax
on tea would have continued to
be unpopular and tobacco had
hardly become a popular target.

On the other hand, it was
obvious that the government
had to have some source of rev-
enue to pay for basic operations
and whiskey got caught up in
the same demise that tobacco
is going through today.

Early Christians figured it
was a sin to drink but tolerable
if you taxed it.  That same atti-
tude prevails today.

We have to pay for our sins
and society has deemed smok-
ing to be a sin far worse than
drunkenness or pigging out on
fat if you look only at the tax
implications.

 On the other hand, if one
drinks too much and gets out
on the road under the influence
of booze, one has the chance of
getting arrested if one drives
erratically or gets involved in
an accident while inebriated
and one loses one’s driver’s li-
cense for a spell. Should one
cause a serious or fatal accident

while driving drunk, one goes
to jail for a long, long time.
But it’s all left to chance.

In other words, you have to
get caught in the act to be pros-
ecuted for drunk driving. And,
depending on whose statistics
you trust, the chances of get-
ting arrested for being over the
limit on alcohol consumption
are something like 1:100  up to
1:10,000. Nobody really knows
how many drunk drivers are out
there on the roads but the odds
are that you can get away with
it----if you are not totally
soused.

Smoking (regular cigarettes
as opposed to the left handed
type made from wacky backy)
however, does not seem to be a
cause for major alarm among
folks concerned with vices that
cause automobile accidents.
Non-smokers and tax advo-
cates claim they are only pay-
ing a small portion of the cost
of public health caused by
smokers who wind up with can-
cer. And they may be right.

On the other hand, why are
these folks not up in arms about
alcohol’s contribution to obe-
sity, high blood pressure, heart
disease, brain damage,  liver
melt-down, decreased produc-
tion  in the workplace, not to
mention being the cause of 50%
of all fatal traffic accidents?

Why is obesity caused by
grease burgers left out of all this
arguing about the causes of ill
health, not to mention the dam-
age wrappers and  containers
cause our environment?

Kentucky, as you know if
you live outside a cave, is con-
sidering an increase of 60 cents
per pack on cigarettes.  Why
not put a similar tax on booze
or at least commission a study
on the effects that drinking has
on the cost of health care, in-
surance, decreased production
and so forth? I’m thinking 60
cents per six pack and sixty
cents per bottle of the hard stuff
would be about right?

Having helped clean up
roadsides over the years, I can
guarantee you that putting a ten
cents per wrapper or container
refundable tax on fast food and
beverage containers would
generate revenue and clean up
our roads and creeks.  A decent
living could be made just by
servicing Paint Lick and we
don’t even have any fast food
chains or liquor stores.

Bottom line is that Kentucky
would not have any revenue
problems if we taxed all vices
and causes of ill health at the
same rate. We should also be
able to afford the best funded
education system in the nation
and, at the same time, have
scenery that is nearly as beau-
tiful as we claim it is.

(Cont. to A3)

As most of you know by
now, I consider my grandfather
(Pop) to be one of my all-time
heroes. When my parents di-
vorced, I was only six or seven
years old, and my mother and I
moved in with Pop and
Mommie Katie. Pop became
my surrogate father. His advice
and constant instruction guided
my young life. Some of that
advice followed me throughout
my adult life. And some was
rather amusing. A sampling fol-
lows.

Each year in the spring, Pop
borrowed a team of mules from
one of his friends in order to
turn the ground for his garden.
Pop was extremely dedicated to
the selection of the plot for his
garden spot. The results them-
selves testified to his success in
annually rotating his crops.

One year while walking be-
hind the mules, Pop caught the
edge of the plow blade on a
stump in the middle of his gar-
den-to-be. The blade flipped up
and the mules stumbled trying
to keep in a straight line. In ob-
servation of the event, and in
an effort to create some sort of
teaching moment, Pop soon af-
ter remarked, “This job is a lot
simpler if you plow around the
stumps.” He and I shared a
good laugh at his moment of
wisdom.

Late one afternoon, Pop and
I were sitting under a large
shade tree in his yard after he

had just returned from the Mt.
Vernon Bank and the Post Of-
fice. Keep in mind that his
weekly trip to the bank and his
daily visit to the Post Office
were very important to him. He
always kept up with his fi-
nances and with anything that
required attention from the
mail.

That particular day some-

Kentucky native is oldest
college basketball player ever

The oldest active player in
the history of college basket-
ball has encountered a lot of ce-
lebrities over the last few
months.

But the one person Ken
Mink would most like to meet
has yet to step forward.

In 1955-56, the native of the

tiny Perry County town of
Vicco in eastern Kentucky was
a star player for Lees Junior
College in Jackson.

At the start of his sopho-
more season, Lees opened up
their brand new gym with an
upset of the University of Ken-
tucky freshmen, led by future
UK all-star Johnny Cox.

Mink had 16 points, and the
son of a coal miner was dis-
playing skills that could earn
him a scholarship at a four-year
school.

But six games into the sea-
son, he was kicked off the team
and out of school after being
accused of spraying shaving
cream in his coach’s shoes and
office.

Mink has always main-
tained his innocence.

Sitting at a table in a
Shoney’s restaurant in
Harriman, Tennessee last
week, Mink told his story after
returning from his second trip
to the buffet bar.

“My getting kicked out of
school was very unfair because
I simply didn’t do it,” he said.

“I told them I didn’t even
shave. And even if I had done
it, the punishment was unjust.
There were guys caught with
girls in their rooms after mid-
night who didn’t get kicked out
of school.”

The old story has received
renewed interest since October
of last year when the resident
of Farragut, Tenn., decided he
wanted to go back to school
and finish what he started.

As a member of the senior
Olympics team, the Smokey
Mountain Papas, he had proven
he could still play, but he knew
that convincing a school to give
him an opportunity could be a
problem.

The semi- retired journalist
sent letters out to coaches at
several schools within a rea-
sonable driving distance of his
home.

Only one, Randy Nesbit of
Roane Community College,
responded, offering the white-
haired grandfather a chance to
join the team as a walk-on.

Nesbit, 50, a former player
and coach at The Citadel, says
he has trouble saying no to de-
serving people willing to work
hard at achieving their goals.

The leader of Roane for the
past 17 years was also influ-
enced by his new recruit’s con-
ditioning.

“He’s not a freak of nature
beating Father Time,” Nesbit
told the Knoxville News-Sen-
tinel. “There’s no special diet.
People pull for him because he
looks like a 73-year-old man.
If people stay active and
healthy, a lot could do what
he’s doing.”

Working hard and staying
active has never been a prob-
lem for the globe-trotting Ken-
tucky native.

He has earned dozens of
honors and stayed in shape
while participating in golf,
snow skiing, hiking and basket-
ball. He has even tried hang
gliding off Lookout Mountain.

“I can’t remember a week in
my life where I didn’t take part
in some sport,” says Mink.

During pre-season condi-
tioning drills, Mink was
clocked at 6.6 seconds in the
40-yard dash while all his
teammates finished under five.
He also discovered his 30-inch
vertical leap in high school had
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Bookmobile Schedule
Mon., Jan. 26: Spiro, Level Green, Willailla, Country Care.
Tues., Jan. 27: Ottawa and Bee Lick. Wed., Jan. 21st: Make-
up day in case of inclement weather.

Rockcastle Travelers Note
Rockcastle Travelers are going to Washington, D.C. during
Spring Break, March 31-April 4. There are still a few spaces
left for this bus tour. A $50 deposit within the next two weeks
will hold your seat. Balance due in February. Call Sue at 256-
2012.

Project Graduation Meeting
There will be a Project Graduation 2009 meeting Monday, Feb.
2nd at 6:30 in the high school cafeteria. All students - Avon
orders are due that night. Meetings will follow on the first
Monday of each month. All parents/guardians of seniors are
urged to attend.

UNITE Meetings
UNITE monthly meetings are held the second Wednesday of
each month. The next meeting will be Feb. 11th at noon at
Pizza Hut.

World Wrestling Event
The World Wrestling Cartel will have matches at the
Broughtontown Community Center on Feb. 7th. Doors open
at 7:30, matches start at 8 p.m. Wrestlers featured include Black
Rain, Gorgeous Jimmy Funk and Brian Lawless. Admission is
$8 per person and tickets are on sale at Saylor’s Market in
Crab Orchard. This event will benefit the Broughtontown Com-
munity Center.

WWC At Crab Orchard
Berea Parks and Recreation is excited to offer Winter Wonder-
land! This free special event has been specifically designed
for individuals with special needs of all ability levels and ages!
Join us on Jan. 16th from 6 to 8 p.m. at the Senior Citizens
Center in Berea for dancing, games, arts and crafts, snacks
and the celebration of winter. Call 986-9402 for more infor-
mation.

Foster/Adoptive Parent Meeting
Are you interested in becoming a foster or adoptive parent?
The Cabinet for Health and Family Services will hold an in-
formational meeting on Jan. 22, 2009 at 6 p.m. at the Rockcastle
CountyDCBS office in the Scott Building on Main Street in
Mt. Vernon. New classes will begin Jan. 27, 2009. For more
information, contact Brandy Baldwin at 606-287-7114.

New Hours for Historical Society
The Rockcastle Historical Society will be open on Mondays
from 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. in the RTEC garage building. Monthly
society meetings are held the 4th Thursday of each month at
5:30 p.m. at the Senior Citizens Building in Mt. Vernon.

RCIDA Meeting
The Rockcastle County Industrial Development Authority
holds its regular meeting the first Mondayof each month at
noon on the third floor of the courthouse.

NA Women’s Meeting
The Women’s NA Serenity Group of Mt. Vernon meets each
Monday at 8 p.m. at the Christian Appalachian Project Com-
munity Center, 64 Beiting Lane, Mt. Vernon. Open meeting -
non-smoking.

Kiwanis Club Meetings
The Rockcastle Kiwanis Club meets every Thursday at noon
at Renfro Valley Lodge.

Women’s Narcotics Meeting
There will be a Women’s Narcotics Anonymous Meeting ev-
ery Monday evening at 8 p.m. at the Community Center, spon-
sored by Christian Appalachian Center. For more information,
contact the Healing Rain Center at 256-5810.

Alcoholics Anonymous
Alcoholics Anonymous meets Tuesday nights at 8 p.m. be-
hind Our Lady of Mt. Vernon Church on Williams St. in Mt.
Vernon.

Narcotics Anonymous
Narcotics Anonymous meets Thursday nights at 8 o’clock be-
hind Our Lady of Mt. Vernon Church on Williams St. in Mt.
Vernon.
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Strep Throat Easily Cured
Presented by Dr. Kimberly Cornelius

Every winter people start to worry about strep throat.  Strep
infections are increased at this time of year because children
are grouped together in school and people are indoors and in
closer contact with one another.

Strep is a contagious bacteria which can infect many areas,
but the most common area is the throat
where it infects the tonsils.  Strep can
also invade the ears, lungs, sinuses and
skin.

When the tonsils get infected, a per-
son usually has a rather rapid onset of
sore throat and a fever.  Swollen glands
quickly develop in the neck at the angle
of the jaw.  Mono and other viruses can
act in very similar ways, however.

Other common symptoms include a headache and a stom-
ach ache.  Strep throat usually lacks the typical viral symp-
toms, such as coughing, sneezing and runny nose.

Strep throat can be confirmed by doing a throat culture.
There is now a quick test to diagnose strep in a matter of min-
utes, so appropriate treatment can begin right away.

Strep is very sensitive to penicillin, which is normally the
best choice of antibiotics.  Other antibiotics may be used if a
person has a penicillin allergy.  Treatment is very effective,
and a person usually feels better as quickly as he got ill.

Strep is less contageous than viruses, and after treating it
for a day or two, it is no longer contagious.  A child can return
to school in one to two days if he feels well and has no fever.
The penicillin must be used for at least seven to ten days, how-
ever, to prevent the possibility of rheumatic fever.

Shop With A Cop
was successful...
Dear Editor,

The Rockcastle County
Sheriff’s Department and Li-
ons’ Club’s Shop With a Cop

program was a great success
this yar.

We would like to thank the
following for their wonderful
support:

John’s Cellular, Rick
Anderkin, Fairview Baptist

Church, Kenneth R. Jacques,
Danny and Sue Ford, Cledith
and Barbara Thacker, Charles
L. Burton, London Back and
Neck Treatment Center, Bruce
and Wanda Kirby, Hilltop Pro-
duce, Sheriff Mike Peters,
Cletis Peters, J&D Cabinets,
Peggy Schneider, Northside
Baptist Church and, especially,
Mike Deborde for his tireless
work this year.

A special thanks to the three
families involved. They made
our Christmas much more spe-
cial.

Deputy Jason Kirby 1115
Sheriff Mike Peters
All the RCSD Staff

“Memories”
(Cont. from A2)

thing that he had seen or had
heard at the bank apparently
was on his mind. Without fur-
ther explanation, he simply said
to me, “One thing you should
know: keep skunks, bankers,
and lawyers at a distance.” I did
not inquire what he was think-
ing or why he had said that. I
knew better. If he had wanted
to elaborate, he would have ex-
plained his thoughts. I kept my
mouth shut – but I was grinning
from ear to ear.

One of my so-called friends
who lived in our neighborhood
was about three years older
than I was, and he constantly
“picked on” me. One day I fi-
nally asked Pop what I should
about this constant aggravation.
His advice was, “David Joe,
some people are just mean, and
meanness don’t just happen
overnight. You should forgive
your enemies; it messes up their
minds.” I took his advice, and
the situation seemed to resolve
itself. The guy stopped picking
on me.

While I was in high school,
I applied for a job as night jani-
tor of the Dinner Bell Restau-
rant. To my dismay, an older
friend of mine also applied for
the position. I was sure that
because he was more experi-
enced he would get the job. I
took my concerns to Pop. Af-
ter listening to my plight, he
simply said, “Every path you
take has a few puddles. Most
of the stuff we worry about
ain’t never gonna happen any-
way.”

Amazingly enough, I took
his advice. I gave up my wor-
ries and simply waited on the
decision from the owner of the
café. After a few days, I was
given the job. Pop was exactly
right; there really wasn’t any
reason to worry about it. It
wouldn’t have changed things
one way or the other.

Then there was the night
when my cousin Patsy and I
were riding around in my ’58
Chevy and she told me a secret
that I was not supposed to tell
anyone. Another of my friends
asked me to tell what Patsy had
said. To him it was a very big
deal, so I asked Pop whether it
would be okay to break my
promise to Patsy. His response
was priceless: “Lettin’ the cat
outta the bag is a whole lot
easier than puttin’ it back in.”
As always, his advice was the
best way to handle the situation.
I kept my promise to Patsy and
everything was fine.

Late one fall day, several
teenagers decided to attend the
Little World’s Fair in Brodhead
and asked me to go with them.
Some of these teens had repu-
tations that were, shall we say,
questionable. I decided to con-
fer with Pop about whether to
go. He expressed his opinion
quite plainly: “When you wal-
low with pigs, expect to get
dirty.” Obviously, it seemed

“Ken & Tucky”
(Cont. from A2)

reasonable not to go with the
crowd.

The following day I learned
that the car load of teens had
been in trouble with the local
sheriff. When I told Pop the
news, he said, “You should live
a good, honorable life and
watch your reputation.”

In all the years that I lived
with my mother and grandpar-
ents, I cannot remember one
time when they gave me ques-
tionable advice. Just as anyone
human, I did ignore them on
occasion, and usually the re-
sults were not in my favor.

They were fine Christians,
and I am so glad that I was able
to live under their influence.
They were a blessing to me –
one that has become more
priceless as the years have
passed. I now know that they
were tender mercies to me from
the good Lord.

(You can reach me at
mtnman@mis.net  or you can drop
me a line at P.O. Box 927- Stanton,

KY 40380. I appreciate your
comments and suggestions.)

fallen to 20.
Although he feels the game

is “about 90 percent the same”
as when he played in the 1950s,
he marvels at the speed and
abilities of today’s players.

“Back in my high school
and college days, I never saw
anybody dunk in a game,” he
says.

Mink has also had to adjust
to modern basketball lingo
coming from his teammates,
eight of whom are African-
Americans.

“When they say, ‘Come
here, dog,’ and ‘Gimmie the
rock,’ I just usually call them
by their first names,” says
Mink.

The 6’1” rookie has gotten
into six of Roane’s first 18
games and knocked down three
of four free throw attempts. He
is 0 for 3 on field goals, but
notes “They’ve all been close.”
He has also picked up one steal.

Nearly everyone, including
teammates and supporters of
opposing teams, pull for him,
but his biggest fan in the stands
is his wife, Emilia, 68.

She wore a retro cheerleader
outfit to the season opener,
complete with saddle shoes and
a poodle skirt. She even held
up a sign that said, “Ken Can.
He’s Our Medicare Man.”

The man who once scored
17 points in a single quarter for
Dilce Combs High School has
set a goal of scoring 10 points
this season.

Getting open looks at the
basket hasn’t been easy.

“Seventy-three is seventy-
three, and I can’t expect to be
anywhere close to as good as I
once was, but I can still be a
threat, so they guard me tight,”
he says.

“Also, everywhere we go,
they cameras are pointed at me,
and that can be intimidating.”

Mink, who says he consid-
ers himself “a pretty strong
Christian,” feels all the atten-
tion being focused on him can
have a positive effect on oth-
ers.

“I know it’s through the
grace of God I’m able to do
this, and if people see that a 73-
year-old guy can get out there
and play at this level, maybe
they’ll realize they at least can
get off the couch and so
something….play golf…walk,
or whatever.

He has received hundreds of
emails from people congratu-
lating him on his accomplish-
ments and letting him know he

has been an inspiration to older
people.

Another aspect of college in
which Mink finds himself set-
ting a good example in is aca-
demics.

Even long bus rides that
sometimes find the team not
returning to campus until 4 or
5 a.m. on weekdays haven’t
kept Mink from earning B’s
and possibly an A (“I’m still
waiting on the results of one
test,”) for his first semester
classes.

The most senior member of
any team in the history of col-
lege hoops isn’t sure where his
athletic and academic accom-
plishments will take him, but
he’s grateful for the ride he’s
had already.

As editor of The Traveling
Adventurer Magazine, he and
Emilia plan to see more of the
world.

And next basketball season
he expects to be back on the
court for the Smokey Mountain
Papas, playing half-court 3-on-
3 ball with people much closer
to his age.

Meanwhile, the couple is
staying busy with appearances
on TV shows such as Regis &
Kelly, Today, Conan O’Brien,
CBS Evening News, and
ESPN.

Ken has also signed with a
literary agent in New York City
to write a book about his expe-
riences, and negotiations are
underway for a movie.

According to Mink, ESPN
is planning a lengthy segment
on him and is in the process of
making contact with the now
95-year-old college president
who kicked him out of school.

There is one other person
who Mink hopes will come for-
ward in the wake of all the
publicity….whoever actually
did the soaping of the coach’s
office.

“With all this book and
movie talk, I may be on the
threshold of making thousands
of dollars,” he says.

“I’d like to meet the guy re-
sponsible for helping put me in
this situation. At least take him
out to dinner……if he’s still
living.”

Daisy Girl Scout Joliann Parsons, daughter of Marsha and
David Parsons, attended an evening of “Etiquette” learning
and fun at the Tea Cup Cafe in Mt. Vernon. Joliann joined 30
other K-1st grade girls in Rockcastle Co. Joliann is a member
of Girl Scout Troop 135 at Roundstone Elementary. Cassandra
Holk is the leader.

Jasmine Daniels attends Mt. Vernon Elementary and is the
daughter of Angel Daniels. Jasmine is in Girl Scout Troop
216. Billie Tankersley is the leader. It is not too late to join a
Girl Scout Troop in Rockcastle County and to participate in
the cookie sales! The next fun event will be on Tuesday, Feb-
ruary 3rd from 6 to 8 p.m. at the Assembly of God Lighthouse
in Mt. Vernon. This event is called “Snowflakes and Smiles”
and is for all girls in grades K-3. To find out more about “Snow-
flakes and Smiles” or to join a Girl Scout Troop, call the Lon-
don Service Center at 606-878-8555 or email Sue Ward at
sward@gswrc.org.

For Sale
32x60 metal bldg. to be moved.

3 Bays. 6x6 treated posts. Insulated.
Framed up for office.
Call Roger Payne at

256-9795 or 859-661-3159
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ObituariesObituaries

Vallie Nancy
Burton

Vallie Nancy Griffin Bur-
ton, 94, of Mt. Vernon, died
Monday, January 19, 2009.
She was born in Rockcastle
County on January 6, 1915 the
daughter of the late Harrison
and Martha Rucker Griffin. She
became a Christian in her early
teens and was of the Pentecos-
tal faith having been a member
of the Mt. Vernon Pentecostal
Church but was unable to at-
tend Church for a few years due
to her failing health. When she
was able, she loved to crochet,
garden and her flowers. She
also enjoyed Christian radio
and Christian programs on tele-
vision. She loved her family
and friends and she will be
greatly missed.

She is survived by: her son,
Harris (Wanda) Burton of
Brindle Ridge; a daughter,
Mattie Newton (Danny Dale)
Petrey of Somerset; one sister,
Mary Griffin Roberts of
Rutledge, TN; one brother-in-
law, Ervin (Fannie) Barron of
Brodhead;  four grandchildren,
Stanley (Sherri) Burton of
Ohio, Kenneth (Brenda) Bur-
ton of Alabama, Nancy Anglin
Hurley of Mt. Vernon and
Sheila Burton (Chafic) Zenni
of Cincinnati, OH; one nephew,
Wayne (Jean) Roberts of
Jefferson City, TN; five step-
grandchildren, Samuel D.
Newton or Oregon, Mary S.
Newton of Somerset, Penny G.
Newton of Lexington, Jennifer
K. Jones of Bronston and Kristi
(Gary) Rowe of Eubank; sev-
eral great grandchildren, Penny
Burton, Erik Burton, Travis
Burton, Tatiana B. Zenni, John
D. Hurley, Amina Zenni and
Rebekah Hurley; several step
great grandchildren some of
which are, Gentry and Kristie
Keibler and Deven, Samantha
Jones, Zackery Dale and Mor-
gan Rowe; and two great great
grandchildren.  She is also sur-
vived by her extended family:
John Chapman of Somerset,
Vernon and Shirley Martin of
London, who also called her
Mom, Junior and Linda
Blanton of Mt. Vernon who vis-
ited her quite often, Brenda and
Jake Brown of Eubank, Esther
and James Houston of Cincin-
nati, Edward and Geneva
Houston and Patricia Holland
of Mt. Vernon.  She has lots of
telephone friends and writing
buddies from Ohio to Florida.

In addition to her parents,
she was preceded in death by:
her husband of 58 years,
George F. Burton, who died
May 28, 1990; two children,
Bennett L. Burton and Barbara
L. Burton Anglin; two son-in-
laws, Samuel G. Newton and
Bobby Anglin; a daughter-in-
law, Shirley Blanton Burton;
three brother-in-laws, Troy
Roberts, Gravely Burton and
Clyde Burton; and two sister-
in-laws, Clara Smith Burton
and Mae Burton Barron.

Funeral services will be
conducted Friday, January 23rd
at 11 a.m. at the Dowell & Mar-
tin Funeral Home by Bros.
Buford Parkerson and Vernon
Martin.  Burial will follow in
Elmwood Cemetery. Friends
may call from 6-9 p.m. (today)
Thursday at the funeral home.

Pallbearers will be: Kenny
Burton, Travis Burton, Gary
Cromer, Danny Ford, Sam
Ford, Gary Rowe and Chafic
Zenni.

Honorary pallbearers will
be: Ervin Barron, Junior
Blanton, Erik Burton, Stanley
Burton, John Chapman, Henry
Coffey, Al Elliott, Doug Grif-
fin, Edward Houston, James
Houston, John David Hurley
and Zack Rowe.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view online obituary.

Billy Bullock
Billy Bullock,72 of Mt.

Vernon, died Friday, January
16, 2008 at the Rockcastle Hos-
pital. He was born in Rockcastle
County on October 20, 1936 the

son of Lando and
Janie Bea Bullock. He
was a retired farmer

and an Army National Guard
veteran.

He is survived by: his wife
of 40 years, Lynette South-
wood Bullock;  two brothers,
Luster Bullock of Somerset,
and Russell Bullock of
Loveland, OH; two sisters,
Bessie Poynter of Somerset,
and Betty Bullock of Mt.
Vernon. Also surviving are sev-
eral nieces and nephews. In ad-
dition to his parents, he was pre-
ceded in death by: four broth-
ers, Ben, Glen, Lester, and
Monroe Bullock; a sister, Janet
K. McClure.

Funeral services were con-
ducted January 21st at the
Dowell & Martin Funeral
Home Chapel by Bro. Virgil
Bustle. Burial was in the Bul-
lock Family Cemetery.

Pallbearers were: Mark Bul-
lock, Darrell Doan, Jesse Mor-
gan, Dale Saylor, Chris Saylor
and Lenny Tipton.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view online obituary.

Alberta Jean
Dillingham
Winstead

Alberta Jean Dillingham
Winstead, 91, of Mt. Vernon,
died Wednesday, January 14,
2009 at her home after a long
illness. She was born in
Rockcastle County on April 20,
1917 the daughter of Dallas and
Mattie Owens Dillingham. A
graduate of Eastern Kentucky
University, she was a retired
teacher for Brodhead School
having served for 26 years. She
also taught at several smaller
Rockcastle County schools and
was the first woman to teach at
Langdon House. She had many
hobbies including collecting
and dressing antique dolls, re-
storing antique furniture, quilt-
ing, as well as many other hob-
bies. She was a member of the
First Baptist Church.

She is survived by: her chil-
dren, James Lee (Gayla)
Winstead of Mt. Vernon and
Edra Jo Mickey of Harrogate,
TN; six grandchildren, Pat
(Carol) Winstead, Angie Tho-
mas, Eddie (Suzanne) Mickey,
Allyson (Elfrem) Taylor, Dr.
Doug (Shelly) Mickey and
Mark Blanton; nine great
grandchildren, Carly Winstead,
Ryan Winstead, Emilee Tho-
mas, Jordan Mickey, Mickey
Taylor, Nichol Mickey
Boatwright, Brandy Mickey,
Bryce Mickey, and Amanda
Blanton; and three great great
grandchildren, Dane Coy
Boatwright, Dallas Miller, and
Jayce Bowles. Also surviving
are several nieces and nephews.

In addition to her parents,
she was preceded in death by:
her husband, Edwin Monroe
Winstead; her son-in-law, Dr.
Coy Mickey; five sisters,
Linnie Brown, Geneva Sears,
Virginia Winstead, Loraine
Hawkins, and Verla Gunn;  and
one brother, Dallas Byron
Dillingham.

Funeral services were con-
ducted Friday, January 16,
2009 at the Dowell & Martin
Funeral Home Chapel by Bro.
Eddie Nation.  Burial was in the
Elmwood Cemetery.

Pallbearers were: Mark
Blanton, Dr. Doug Mickey,
Eddie Scott Mickey, Efrem
Taylor, Dale Winstead and Pat
Winstead.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view online obituary.

Alonzo
McCollum
Alonzo Burnam McCollum,

85, of Roundstone, died Sun-
day, January 18, 2009 at his
home following a short, but
courageous battle with cancer.
He was born in Scaffold Cane
in Rockcastle County on Feb-
ruary 8, 1923 the son of Rollie
Burnam and Addie Sims
McCullum. On June 4, 1950,
he was united in marriage to
Mary Louise Abney.  He was a
member of the Roundstone
Baptist Church where, along
with his wife, were baptized in
1962.  There, he served as dea-
con for many years, Sunday
School Superintendent, and
Sunday School teacher.  He
was retired from the Bluegrass

Army Depot and
was a WWII Army
veteran where he

served in the 303rd Infantry.
During his service, he received
numerous medals and citations
including the American The-
ater Ribbon, Bronze Star, Asi-
atic Pacific Theater Ribbon,
Good Conduct Medal, and the
Victory Medal.  He also re-
ceived the Combat Infantry-
man Badge, Driver and Me-
chanic Badge, Rifle Sharp-
shooter, and Carbine Expert.
He was a member of the VFW,
the Civil Air Patrol, the Repub-
lican Presidential Task Force,
and the American Rifle Asso-
ciation. He served as a Boy
Scout Troop Leader and was
the past Rockcastle County Re-
publican Chairman.  He was
also a 911 Board Member and
a Board Member for the
Brindle Ridge Fire Depart-
ment.  He was known by his
friends as "Lonnie".

He is survived by: two
daughters, Gail McCollum and
Dianne McCollum, both of Mt.
Vernon; one brother, Frank
(Geri) McCollum of Tennes-
see;  and three sisters, Joy
(Charlie) Pingleton of Berea,
Sandra McCollum of Minne-
sota, and Nina (Fred) Abbott of
Indiana.  Also surviving are:
long-time family friends,
Dorothea Vanderwerf and
Joshua Lopez;  and several
nieces and nephews, other rela-
tives, and many friends.  In ad-
dition to his parents, he was
preceded in death by: his wife
of 55 years, Mary Louise
Abney McCollum;  three
brothers, Edward, Ellis, and
George McCollum; and four
sisters, Janie Durham, Eleanor
Bennett, Phamy Amen, and
Mildred Parsons.

Funeral services will be
conducted (today) Thursday,
January 22 at 11 a.m. at the
Dowell & Martin Funeral
Home Chapel by Revs. Rick
Reynolds and Robert Moore.
Burial will follow in the Scaf-
fold Cane Cemetery.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view online obituary.

Charles
Christopher

Greer
Charles Christopher Greer,

29, of Richmond, KY, died on
Sunday, January 11, 2009, at
this home. He was born on
April 26, 1979, in Lincoln
County as the second child of
Charlie and Helen Greer.

Survivors include his
daughter, Callie, of Richmond,
KY.  In addition, he is survived
by four siblings, from oldest to
youngest: Tammy (Danny)
Miller of Mt. Vernon, Amanda
(Ricky) Winkler of Richmond,
Chuck (Ashley) Napier of
Brodhead and Dale (Stacy)
Greer of Lexington.

Funeral services were con-
ducted on Thursday, January
15th at the Combs, Parsons,
and Collins Funeral Chapel in
Richmond, KY, by Brother
Don Stayton.  Burial followed
at the Piney Grove Cemetery
in Brodhead.

"Let us help you hear better"
• Lowest Prices
• Best Service
• Free Hearing Exam

Roses-Tradewind Shopping Center, Somerset, KY
Call for an Appointment 606-678-4010 • 1-800-367-7912 

Affordable Low Monthly Payments
www.southernhearingaid.com©2009 Newspaper Holdings, Inc.

Southern Hearing
Aid, Inc.

In Memory of Aunt Bert
(Melbert Robbins)

January 5, 2009
Today we say goodbye to a

remarkable lady, but we will
never forget the memories we
all made with her.

One of my memories of her
is the outfit of clothes she made
for me, especially my first
prom dress which I still have.
Last, but not least, is how in one
little house she kept the holi-
day traditions Granny Cash
started.  Having wonderful
holiday meals and getting ev-
eryone together.  One of my
favorites was her chicken and
dumplings.

So even though wehave to
say goodbye, we know she is
at peace with all the other loved
ones we have lost.

We love you Aunt Bert and
you will never be forgoten.  I
know I won't.

Libby Gail Ramsey

Ruth Irene
Fain

Ruth Irene Fain, 90, of
Mt.Vernon, died Wednesday
January 14, 2008 at the
Rockcastle Hospital. She was
born on June 11, 1918 at Pine
Hill, KY the daughter of the
late Lelland and Lottie
Carmichael McHargue. She
was a retired merchant and flo-
rist, was a former owner and
operator of the Mt.Vernon Flo-
rist, enjoyed flowers, spending
time with her grandchildren, a
UK Wildcats fan, and was a
member of the Bible Baptist
Church.

Survivors are: her husband,
Lee Fain of Mt.Vernon; one
son, Bill (Barbara) Fain of
Livingston; one daughter,  Judy
(Bobby) Bullock of Midway,
KY; two brothers, A.P.
McHargue of Indianapolis, IN,
and Wendell McHargue of Me-
lissa, TX; four grandchildren;
and six great grandchildren.
She was preceded in death by:
four brothers, J.L., Robert,
Chester, and Lee McHargue;
and two sisters, Jean Baker and
Edna Fain.

Funeral services were held
Saturday, January 17, 2009 at
the Bible Baptist Church with
Bro. Don Stayton officiating.
Burial was in Elmwood Cem-
etery. Arrangements made by
Cox Funeral Home.

Pallbearers were: Dennis
Baker, Oscar Fain, Blaine
McHargue, Howard
McHargue, Lloyd Fain, Joe
Fain, Jim Fain, and Gary Fain.

Send condolences online at
www.coxfuneralhomeky.com

Main
Street

$100 Monthly Cash Give-Away
$25 Weekly Gas Give-Away

Located at 150 Main St. • Mt. Vernon
Next to Dr. Griffith’s Office

Monday thru Friday 9 a.m. to 6 p.m.
Saturday 9 a.m. to 1 p.m.

256-0475

“The People You Know, The People You Trust”
From left: Tara Brown, Allie Reynolds,

pharmacist Danette Craig, Kevin Craig and Tanner Bray.

Robert
Kenneth

Bales
Bob Bales, 79, of West

Chester, OH, died January 19,
2009. He was born July 13,
1929 in Mt Vernon where he
lived with his family, Cabble
and Mae Bales and siblings.

He left for southwest
Ohio when his par-
ents divorced but al-
ways claimed the Mt.

Vernon area as his home. He
and Joyce, his wife of 57 years,
lived in West Chester, OH. He
was a proud WWII veteran
having enlisted in the navy at
the age of 15.  He was stationed
on one of the ships that took
part in the Eniwetok Atomic
Bomb tests shortly after the
conclusion of the war.  He
worked as a plant manager with
companies in Ohio and Texas
in the building trade. Ensuing
his early years as a stock car
driver, he was an avid
NASCAR fan.

He is survived by: his wife,
Joyce; his children, Michael of
Deerfield Township, OH and
Cherie Lynn (Jonathan) Smith
of Dallas, TX; sister, Loretta
Bales Terry of Mason, OH;
brothers, Jimmie (Betty) and
Lawrence (Evelyn) Bales of
West Chester, OH; and his step-
brother, Charles “Bud”
Mattingly (Corrine) of Ocala,
FL.

He was preceded in death
by: his parents; and brothers,
Henry Lee and John Cabble
Bales, Jr.; and step-brother,
Gene Mattingly.

Private services will be held
on Saturday, January 24, 2009
at Shorten-Ryan Funeral
Home, West Chester, OH with
interment following at the West
Chester Cemetery.

Dallas E.
Falin

Dallas E. Falin, 58, of Mt.
Vernon, died Monday, January
19, 2009 at his home.

Funeral services are incom-
plete at this time.

Arrangements are by the
Dowell & Martin Funeral
Home.

A complete obituary will
appear in next week’s Signal.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view online obituary.

Roscoe
Sowder

Roscoe Sowder, 81, of
Springboro, OH and formerly
of Prebel County, OH died
January 1, 2009 at Hospice of
Dayton. Mr. Sowder was born
and raised in Mt. Vernon. He
was a member of Middletown
Sportsman Club and had loved
trapshooting.

He is survived by: two sons,
Michael Sowder of Eaton, OH
and Larry (JoAnn) Sowder of

In Loving
Memory

Subscribe to
the Signal

Liberty Township, OH; one
daughter, Kaye (Michael)
Sherman of Miamisburg, OH;
four grandchildren and five
great grandchildren and a sis-
ter-in-law, Janice Sowder of
Mt. Vernon.

He was preceded in death
by his parents, William Booth
“Bootie” Sowder and Rosa
Hearld Sowder; six brothers,
Kenneth, Tude, Bill “Slick”,
Chester “Bud” Shirley and
Casper; five sisters, Lila Mae,
Syble, Dovie, Roberta Chris-
tine and Nannie.

Funeral services were held
Monday, January 5, 2009 at
Lindloff-Zimmerman Funeral
Home in West Alexandria.

PRICES SUBJECT TO CHANGE

PRICES SUBJECT TO CHANGE

BEREA LOCATION
NOW BUYING

CARS
Also, STEEL, TIN, APPLIANCES

and CAST IRON
Please call in advance for details and

handling procedures

  $90
Mid-State
Recycling
Company

1577 Mt. Vernon Rd. • Berea, Ky.
606-256-1388 • Open M - F 8 to 4

per ton

Anne Lukas
Taylor

Anne Lukas Taylor, 86,
widow of Gene E. Taylor of
Brodhead, died Friday, January
16, 2009 at the Rockcastle
Health and Rehabilitation. She
was born March 4th, 1921 in
Zeigler, IL, a daughter of the
late John Lukas and Mary
Lukas. She was a member of the
Providence church of Christ,
was a retired Postal Clerk and
her hobbies and interest were
sewing, reading and traveling.

Those left to cherish her
memory are: her step son,
Wayman Taylor of Louisville;
two nephews, James G.
McClung of Rupert, WV and
Ray Nelson McClung of
Proctorville, OH; brother-in-
law, Jesse (Helen) Taylor of
Brodhead; and a host of friends
and neighbors.

Funeral services were con-
ducted Monday, January 19th,
2009 at the Marvin E. Owens
Home for Funerals Chapel with
Danny McKibben officiating.
Burial followed in the Provi-
dence Cemetery.
Condolencesmay be made online at

www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com
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Tampico

Citrus Punch

169

8 Lb. Russet

Potatoes

250

Campbell’s
Super Bakes

250

Freschetta

Meat Medley
Pizzas

349

Center Cut
Pork Chops

179

Beef

Rib Eye
Steaks

499

Hormel
 Microwave

Meals

89¢

Healthy Choice Panina

Chicken Basil or
Cheese Steak

200

Mrs. Smith’s Frozen
Apple Crumb Pies

299

Family Pack

Chicken

Tenders

179

Family Pk, Asst.

Qtr. Loin
Pork Chops

139

Extra Savings

**Save up to 40% Everyday on  your
total grocery bill**

910 W. Main St. • Mt. Vernon • 606-256-9810
Open 7 Days a Week • 8 a.m. to 9 p.m.

We Gladly Accept WIC and EBT

lb.

Extra Savings

Lb.

Green Cabbage

29¢
Extra Savings Extra Savings

Extra Savings Extra Savings

7 1/2 oz. cups
Asst.

Extra Savings Extra Savings

Extra Savings Extra Savings

Ripe
Tomatoes

89¢

Extra Savings Extra Savings

Extra SavingsExtra Savings

Lb.

46 oz.16.8 oz.

Lb.

Gallon

Lb.

Mini Carrots

99¢

Betty Crocker

Complete Meals

329
Asst.

Flavors

1 lb. bag

6 oz.

Asst. Flavors

Lb.

Lb.

Field’s
LARD

2999
25 Lb.

Mary
Elizabeth

Doan
Mary Elizabeth Doan, 73,

of Franklin, IN and formerly of
Mt. Vernon, died Thursday,
January 15, 2009 at the Com-
passionate Care Center in
Richmond. She was born in
Mt. Vernon on July 7, 1935 the
daughter of Leonard and Ha-
zel Evans Price. She was a re-
tired assembly line worker and
a member of the First Separate
Baptist Church in Franklin, IN.

She is survived by: two
sons, Albert Vernon (Delphy)
Price of Chestnut Ridge and
Randall Melvin Doan of
Franklin, IN; four daughters,
Janice Gail Doan of Indianapo-
lis, IN, Freda Doreen Wise of
Davenport, FL, Brenda Carol
Doan also of Davenport, FL
and Elizabeth Ann Doan of
Franklin, IN; two brothers,
Russell Price and Robert Earl
Price, both of Berea; and two
sisters, Norma Jean Owens and
Darlene Chrisman, both of
Berea.  Also surviving are 13
grandchildren and 10 great
grandchildren. In addition to
her parents she was preceded
in death by: her husband, Arie
Doan; one daughter, Jenny
Doan; and three sisters,
Jallette Bell, Ima Jean Baker
and Betty Jo Johnson.

Funeral services were con-
ducted Sunday, January 18,
2009 at the Dowell & Martin
Funeral Home Chapel by Bro.
Ed Tharpe. Burial followed in
Elmwood Cemetery.

Pallbearers were: Dustin
Agee, Matthew Doan, Bobby
Kayler, Scottie McFerron, Der-
rick Price, Michael Price, Rob-
ert Price and John W. Ramey,
Jr.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view obituary.

Marvin
Kenneth
Bullock

Marvin Kenneth Bullock,
77, husband of Lorene Barron
Bullock of Quail, died Thurs-
day, January 15th, 2009 at the
Pattie A. Clay Hospital in Rich-
mond. He was born on March
10th, 1931 in Wabd, the son of
the late Curtis H. Bullock and
Ada Hasty Bullock.  He was a
farmer and a member of the

Chestnut Ridge
Church of Christ.
Kenneth was an
Army Veteran. His

hobbies and interest were farm-
ing and trading knives and
guns.  On June 30th, 1955 he
was united in holy matrimony
to Lorene Barron Bullock and
from that union came four chil-
dren, Kenneth Randall, Tammy
S., Charles C., and Michael
Darren.

Those left to cherish his
memory include: his wife of 53
years, Lorene Barron Bullock
of Quail; three children, Ken-
neth Randall (Frances) Bullock
of Kings Mountain, Tammy S.
(Ricky) Bray of Brodhead and
Charles C. (Carrie Lynn) Bul-
lock of Mt. Vernon; eight
grandchildren; six great grand-
children; two sisters, Burnetta
Norton of Mt. Vernon and Bar-
bara (Delmas) Bullock of Mt.
Vernon; three brothers, Gilbert
Clinton (Lucille) Bullock of
Fairfield, OH and Lester H.
(Karen Sayers) Bullock and
Benton (Theresa) Bullock,
both of Mt. Vernon; and a host
of nieces, nephews, friends and
neighbors.

Besides his parents, he was
preceded in death by: a son,
Michael Darren Bullock; one
grandchild, Beth Ann Kelly;
one brother, D. L. Bullock; and
three sisters, Lura Robinson,
Sue Tabor, and Clara Dean
Davidson.

Funeral services were con-
ducted Sunday, January 18th,
2009 at the Marvin E. Owens
Home for Funerals Chapel with
Bro. Ova Baker, Bro. Dale
McNew, and Bro. Jim Craig
officiating. Burial followed in
the  Freedom Cemetery with
Military honors by the Corbin
V.F.W. 1410.

Casketbearers were: Zack
Bullock, Matthew Bray, Josh
Bray, Russell Barron, Bobby
Barren and Ricky Bray.

Condolences to the family  may be
made to his online registry at

www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

ObituariesObituaries

Larry Paul
Slone

Larry Paul Slone 60, of
Berea, died Sunday January 18,
2009 at his home. He was born
on January 27, 1948 in Floyd
County the son of the late
Dillard and Virgie Holbrook
Slone. He had been an engineer
for the Nashville Bun Com-
pany, enjoyed hunting, Nascar,
and family and was a member
of the Church of the Lord Jesus
Christ in Lancaster.

Survivors are: his wife,
Sheila Sowder Slone of Berea;
two sons, Earl Wayne Slone of
Ada, OK and Junior Slone of
Cincinnati, OH; two daughters,
Miss Erica Slone and Mrs.
Paula Gordon, both of Cincin-
nati, OH; four sisters, Mrs. Bar-
bara Perras and Mrs. Etta
Grima, both of Cookville, TN,
and Mrs. Nellie Brown and
Mrs. Gail Swank, both of
Baxter, TN; 10 grandchildren;
and two great grandchildren.
He was preceded in death by:
one son, Larry Paul Slone Jr.;
and one brother, Ronald Clay
Slone.

Services were held Tuesday,
January 20, 2009 at the Cox
Funeral Home Chapel with
Bro. Bill Graves officiating.
Burial was in the Church of the
Lord Jesus Christ Cemetery.

Pallbearers were: Ryan
Hartung, Billy Grima, Kevin
Hall, Briar Sowder, Brandon
Sowder and Paul Pippin.

Honorary pallbearers were:
Gary Vickers, Ed Wilson, Brian
Stewart and Darrell Pippin.
View the complete obituary, sign the

guest registry, or send condolences to
the family online at

www.coxfuneralhomeky.com

Carlos Ray
Cunningham

Carlos Ray Cunningham,
30, of Mt. Vernon died Friday,
following an automobile acci-
dent in Garrard County.

Mr. Cunningham was born
November 11, 1978 in Casey
County to Otis Lee and Wanda
Snow Cunningham. He was
employed by Darrell Kidd Ga-
rage Doors and was a member
of the Waynesburg Church of
Christ.

Survivors include his
mother, Wanda Snow Cunning-
ham Coleman; two sons, Corey
Ray and Addison Huston
Cunningham of Mt. Vernon;
four brothers, Otis and Thomas
Cunningham, both of Harrods-
burg, Leroy Belcher of Indiana
and Jerry Cunningham of
Hustonville; seven sisters, Lisa
Cunningham and Elizabeth
Smith of Harrodsburg, Mary
Tinsley and Patricia Nichols,
both of Stanford, Carol Dixon
of Lancaster, Becky Wilson of
Parksville and Ola Pendleton
of Stanford and several nieces
and nephers.

Services were held  January
20th at Spurlin Funeral Home
Chapel with Reverends Terry
Holt and Gary King officiating.

Casketbearers were: Dale
Bingham, Darrell Walls, Terry
Smith, Gary Smith, Greg
Payton, Jeremy Johnson, Joel
Cunningham and Robbie
Tinsley.

Honorary bearers were: Lo-
gan, Dustin, Jayden, Fallon and
Brooke Cunningham, Jacob,
Ashley and Pascha Smith,
Zachary and Cameron Walls
and Abigail Pittman.

Nancy
Hensley

Nancy Louise Gibbons
Hensley, 81, of Orlando, died
Thursday, January 15, 2009 at
the Terrace Rehabilitation Fa-
cility in Berea. She was born
in Lincoln County on August
29, 1927 the daughter of Finley
Gibbons and Mary Hensley.
She was a homemaker and a
member of the Brush Creek
Holiness Church. She enjoyed
cooking, sewing and spending
time with her family. She was
also a very loving and devoted
mother and grandmother.

She is survived by: four
sons,  Frank (Vicky) Hensley
of Berea, Charlie (Penny)
Hensley of Roundstone, Brady
(Suann) Hensley of Livingston
and Ballard (Ethel) Hensley of
Orlando; two daughters, Sylvia
Sue Cook of Mt. Vernon and
Fannie (Butch Broaddus) of
Orlando; one brother, Jim
(Mary) Gibbons of Orlando;
and one sister, Lucy Burnett of
Mt. Vernon.  Also surviving are
14 grandchildren and seven
great grandchildren. In addi-
tion to her parents, she was pre-
ceded in death by: her husband
of 60 years, Joe Hensley; one
son, Jack Hensley; three broth-
ers, Bill, Charlie and John
Henry; and four sisters, Char-
ity, Corty, Gladys and Ella
Mae.

Funeral services were con-
ducted Monday, January 19 at
the Conway Tabernacle Church
of God by Bro. C. W. Williams.
Burial followed in the
Briarfield Cemetery.

Pallbearers were: Jason
Brooks, Jeff Cromer, Chuck
Davis, Justin Hensley, Andy
Rube, Chris VanWinkle and
Clint Walker.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view online obituary.

Pauline
Hamer

Pauline Hamer, 83, of Flo-
rence, KY and formerly of
Livingston, died Friday, Janu-
ary 16, 2009 at St. Elizabeth
South in Edgewood, KY. She
was born in Rockcastle County
on November 25, 1925 the
daughter of George and Effie
McClure Arnold. She was a re-
tired merchant having owned
the City Sundry Store in
Livingston for many years and
a member of the Livingston
Christian Church.

She is survived by: one
daughter, Georgia (Tilmon)
Milburn of Florence; one
grandson, Timothy Milburn of
Elsmere, KY; and one great
grandchild, Taylor Milburn. In
addition to her parents, she was
preceded in death by: her hus-
band, Elvis Hamer; four sisters,
Minnie Ponder, Pearl
Whitaker, Ruby Jarvis and Jean
Ott; and two brothers, Lester
Arnold and Elzie Arnold.

Funeral services were con-
ducted Monday, January 19,
2009 at the Dowell & Martin
Funeral Home Chapel by Bro.
Alan Jackson. Burial followed
in the McGuire Cemetery.
Please visit www.DowellMartin.com

to view online obituary.



Now Serving Breakfast
Biscuits & Gravy • Sausage Biscuit

Bacon Biscuit
7 a.m. to 11 p.m. Daily

Toasted Wraps - $1.29
10 Piece Meal - $16.99

includes 2 sides, 4 biscuits

Open:
Sunday thru Thurs.
7 a.m. to 10 p.m.

Friday and Saturday
7 a.m. to 11 p.m.

U.S. 25 N • Mt. Vernon
606-256-4910

Brodhead Pharmacy
Main Street • Brodhead

606-758-4373
Howard Saylor

Pharmacist
David Collins

Owner

Open:
9:30 to 6:30

Mon. - Fri.

“We Deliver County Wide”

Collins Respiratory
Care

Main Street • Brodhead

606-758-9333
Home Health Equipment & Supplies

Insurance & Medicare Accepted

Brodhead
606-758-8212

Mount Vernon
606-256-2500

McKee
606-287-8390

Somerset
606-451-2274

24 Hour Information Line 1-800-530-8561
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Services were first held in the current building at the Chestnut Ridge Church on Decem-
ber 25th of 1924.

In attendance at Sunday’s services at the Chestnut Ridge
Church of Christ were Charles B. Parsons, left, and Tilman
Owens. Parsons is one of the oldest and longest members
of the church and Owens’ father Albert was a preacher at
Chestnut Ridge in the 1970s.

Lavania and Dale McNew, shown taking part in the song
service at Chestnut Ridge on Sunday, are longtime mem-
bers of the church. Dale McNew has been one of the preach-
ers at Chestnut Ridge since 1993.

Mike Brown, left, Tilman Owens, center and Bill Doan,
waited on the communion table at Chestnut Ridge Church
of Christ on Sunday.  Although the weather was bad in the
county, nearly 80 people attended services.

Chestnut Ridge Church of Christ dates back to 1924
In 1924, the Church of Christ

building at Chestnut Ridge was
constructed on land two miles
south of Mt. Vernon on Hwy.
25.

The church is nestled in the
rural part of Appalachian
Mountains in Rockcastle
County, on top of a hill that
overlooks I-75 off of exit 59.

Tip Langford donated the
land on which the building was
built. Paul Baker donated the
parking lot property. The park-
ing lot was blacktopped around
1991.

The church building was
originally built by the follow-
ing brethern: Logan Owens, Bill
Wheat, Aden Owens, Sam
Fields, Aden Thompson, Walter
Henderson, Burt Baker, Steve
Drew, George Smith, Ova
Smith, Beecher Smith and oth-
ers from the congregation.

Many of their descendants are
members of the church today.

Before the building was con-
structed, the congregation used
the New Chestnut Ridge School
house to worship in. The con-
gregation met for the very first
time in their new building on
December 25th, 1924.

The first seats were boards
supported by nail kegs. The
church was set in order on May
24, 1925 by preacher James
Todd from Crab Orchard.

The church was renovated in
1997. The building went from
siding outside to brick. The in-
side was remodeled to have new
carpet, windows, and an extra
room in the back pulpit area for
the baptistry besides new paint
and other small projects.

The brothers of the church
later added the picnic shelter.
Harold Hamilton, who has been

a church member for many
years, built and donated the pic-
nic tables. The picnic shelter is
used at the end of spring and fall
gospel meetings and other spe-
cial occasions.

Harold’s wife, Lynn
Hamilton, painted the mural in
the baptistry in 1998. The cor-
ner stone was donated by
McNew Momument of
Rockcastle County in 1997
when the renovation occurred.

Some of the preachers from
the beginning were Brothers
Logan Owens, Steve Drew, Ova
Smith, Russell Bullock, Amos
Owens and Bill Smith.

In October of 1987, Brother
Ova Baker from London started
teaching, along with Brother
Zade McClure who is from the
Blue Springs Church of Christ
in Rockcastle County.

Brother McClure preached
for several years on each fifth
Sunday and, in 1993, Brother
Dale McNew of Berea joined
Brother Baker. For Sunday ser-
vices, Brother Baker and Bri.
McNew alternate teaching.

The main worship service is
every Sunday at 10 a.m. Within
the past few years or so,
Wednesday night servics at 7:30
have been added.

Today, Brother Baker and
Brother McNew are the only
church members of Chestnut
Ridge of Christ who are preach-
ers.

There are, however, guest
speakers that teach on Wednes-
day nights. Currently Brother
Marcus Reppert, from Blue
Springs Church of Christ,
Brother Michael Connelley,
from Lexington, Brother Phillip
Scott and Brother Robby Bar-
ren from Bandy Church of
Christ alternate Wednesday

nights. If one guest speaker can-
not make it, either Brother
Baker or Brother McNew will
fill in for them.

An Introduction
To Church of

Christ  Services
Compiled by Bro. Marcus Reppert

Many people are hesitant to
visit a church without knowing
something about it. Hopefully,
this information will help
people understand more about
the Church of Christ.

When you attend  services,
you will find them conducted in
a simple, dignified and orderly
way. You will see in the mem-
bers a deep respect for God’s
Holy Word. We recognize the
Bible as our only rule of faith
and practice and our services
are observed in “spirit and
truth” (John 4:23-24; 17-17).

Our singing is done as a con-
gregation, without the aid of a
mechanical instrument of mu-
sic. In acapella singing, we
praise God making “melody in
our hearts to the Lord” (Eph.
5:19; Col. 3:16). The songs
sung are selected with care, so
that they convey our feelings of
devotion and worship.

In our public worship ser-
vices, the men do the instruct-
ing in truth and righteous liv-
ing. The women keep silent as
learners, along with other men
and children  (I Cor. 14:34 I
Tim. 2: 11,12). You are wel-
come to bring your Bible and
follow the teaching as we study
from God’s Word.

The prayers of our service
are led by one man at a time.
The minds of all other worship-
pers are directed on the one
leading. We seek to pray with
the spirit and understanding in
a decent and orderly way (Acts
2:42; I Cor. 14: 15,40).

In prayer, we speak to God
to thank Him for His goodness
toward us and invoke His mercy
on us and His Blessings on our
service and efforts for Him.

Each Lord’s Day (first day
of the week) we strive to ob-
serve the Communion in the
same way it was instituted by
Jesus and bound by the Apostles
(Acts 20:7; Matt 26:26-28; I
Cor. 10: 16,17; 11:1,2, 23-28).
A man serves at the Lord’s

Brother Ova Baker, who has been a preacher at Chestnut
Ridge Church of Christ since 1987, brought Sunday
morning’s message.

(Cont. to A7)



Rockcastle Professional
Pharmacy

Newcomb Ave. • Mt. Vernon
606-256-4613

Open Monday - Friday 8:30 a.m. to 7 p.m.
Sat., 8:30 a.m. to 2 p.m.

“Free Delivery”

Wendy’s • Chevron
Service Center

“The Most Convenient Place In Town”

Singleton Insurance Agency
210 E. Main St. • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

Donnie Singleton, Agent
Insurance Since 1971

606-256-2611

Remember Wendy’s late
night drive-thru open
until midnight Sunday

through Thursday and 1
a.m. Friday and Saturday.
Wendy’s - Chevron Open 7

Days a Week

Stop In and
Check Out
Our New

Chevron Gas
& Gas

Products
“An American Company -
Selling American Products
- Produced By Americans”

Believers House of Prayer
156 Scenic View Lane

U.S. 25 N, left at 18 mile marker
Renfro Valley, Ky.

Sabbath School Sat. 10 -11 a.m.
Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Evening Worship 7 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.
Pastor: Bill Davis

bhop_7@yahoo.com

Berea Reformed
Evangelical Church
1309 Hwy. 21 • Berea

859-248-1600
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Bible Study 6 p.m.
Xon Hostetter, Pastor

Bible Baptist Church
100 Higher Ground (off US 25)

Mount Vernon, Ky.
Church Phone 606-256-5913
e-mail: www.biblebaptist.org

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship/Children’s

Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Video services Tues., Thurs., & Sat.

at 11 a.m., 4 p.m. & 9 p.m.
Channel 3 - New Wave

Cable Channel 5 in Berea and
Richmond 1 p.m. Wednesdays

Pastor: Don Stayton
Associate Pastor/Youth:

Bro. Jeremy Ellis
Kids for Christ

Children’s Ministry:
Bro. Jarrod Amyx

Secretary: Jo Roberts
Music Director: Dan Dull

Blue Springs Church of Christ
7 miles south of Mount Vernon on

Hwy. 1249 (Sand Springs Rd)
Services: Sundays 10 a.m. & 6 p.m.

Preaching Brethren
Zade McClure, Gary Reppert,
Coy Cromer,  Marcus Reppert

Contact Info:
Marcus Reppert

104 Byrda Way • Mt. Vernon, Ky.
606-308-2794

marcusreppert24@hotmail.com

Bride of Christ Church
High St. Mt. Vernon

Sunday Services 7 p.m.

Brodhead Baptist Church
Corner of Silver & Maple St.

Brodhead, Ky. 40409
606-758-8316

Sunday Bible Study 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m. & 6 p.m.

(Nursery Provided)
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 7 p.m.
Children’s Programs: RAs & GAs

Mission Friends and
Creative Ministry

Ralph Baker, Pastor
Brodhead Baptist Church is a

friendly church where everyone is
welcome

Brodhead Christian Church
237 W. Main St.

Brodhead, Ky. 40409
606-758-8721

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m. & 6 p.m.

Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.
Tracy Valentine, Preacher

606-758-8662
Cell 606-305-8980

Brush Creek Holiness Church
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7 p.m.

Tuesday Prayer Meeting 7 p.m.
Special Service 1st Sunday or

each month at 11 a.m.
Lonnie Reese McGuire, Pastor
Calloway Baptist Church

76 Calloway Branch Rd.
(Off US 25) • Calloway
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Scott Mullins, Pastor

Central Baptist Church
86 Maintenance Rd.

Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
606-256-2988

centralbaptistky.org
Pastor: Mark Eaton

Home of “Central Baptist
Christian Academy”
K-12 Private School

“Central Time” Radio Broadcast
WRVK 1460AM

Every weekday Mon.-Fri. 11:15 a.m.
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Morning and Children’s
Church 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study, Prayer
Meeting and “Patch the Pirate

Club”  7 p.m.
Transportation and Nursery

provided for all services
Mark Eaton, Pastor

Climax Christian Church
Hwy. 1912

308-2806 - 256-4138 - 256-5977
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Wade Johnson, Minister

Climax Holiness Church
Sunday Night Worship 6 p.m.

Thursday Nights 7 p.m.
3rd Saturday of every month

at 7 p.m.
1st Sunday of each mo. at 11 a.m.

Darrin Sloan, Pastor

Conway Missionary
Baptist Church

U.S. 25 between Mount Vernon
and Berea

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship 6 p.m.

Wed. Prayer Service and
Bible Study 7 p.m.
Youth Meetings:

Sunday 5 p.m. • Wednesday 7 p.m.
Bro. Jim Ritchey, Pastor

859-200-2679/859-228-0342
Sunday School Director

Ronald Sears • 606-256-5709
606-256-2829

Cornerstone Fellowship
50 Lovell Ct. - Mt. Vernon

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Terry Fletcher, Pastor
606-256-1645

Crossroads Assembly of God
Hwy. 150 • Brodhead

Bro. Stephen Vanhook, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Dixie Park Cornerstone
Baptist Church
700 N. Powell St.
Berea, Ky. 40403

859-623-8292 • 859-985-2484
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Gene Smith, Pastor

Fairview Baptist Church
520 Fairview Loop Road

Mount Vernon, Ky.
Sunday Services

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Children’s Choir 6 p.m.

Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.
Sunday Adult Choir 8 p.m.

Wednesday Services
Creative Ministry 6 p.m.

Bible Study 7 p.m.
Youth Ministry QUEST 7 p.m.

RAs and GAs 7 p.m.
Mission Friends 6 p.m.
Vaughn Rasor, Pastor

606-256-3722
email: fairviewbapt@aol.com

Fairground Hill
Community Holiness Church

Thursday Worship 7 p.m.
Sunday Worship 6 p.m.
Pastor: Benton Hurd

Faith Chapel Pentecostal
S. Wilderness Road
Mount Vernon, Ky.

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Saturday Service 7 p.m.

Virgil Bustle, Pastor

First Baptist Church
340 West Main Street

Mt. Vernon, Ky.
606-256-2922

Bro. Eddie Nation, Pastor
website: www.fbcmvkyorg

email:fbcmtvernon@newwave.net
Sunday Services: 8:30 a.m.,

10:45 a.m. and 7 p.m.
Wednesdays: AWANA and Adult

Bible Study 6:30 p.m.
Live Broadcast WRVK 140AM

Sundays at 11 a.m.
Broadcast on New Wave Cable

Channel 3 Tues., Thurs. & Sunday
at 10 a.m., 3 p.m. & 8 p.m.

First Christian Church
West Main Street
Mt. Vernon, Ky.
606-256-2876

Bro. Bruce Ross, Pastor
Services

Sunday School: 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m. & 6 p.m.

Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.
Kenny Shubert, Youth Pastor

Flat Gap Baptist Church
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
James Poynter, Pastor

606-256-3969

Flat Rock Missionary
Baptist Church

504 Maple Grove Rd. Hwy. 1004
Orlando, Ky. 40460

859-925-4048
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Fellowship Hour 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.
Thursday Night Visiting 7 p.m.

Contact: Doris Brown
606-256-0188

burtonpromos@prodigy.net

Freedom Baptist Church
Freedom School Rd.

Mt. Vernon, KY
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Discipleship Training 6 p.m.
Sunday Evening Worship 7 p.m.

Wednesday Evening Prayer
Meeting & Youth/Children

Classes 7 p.m.

God’s Church of Zion
35 McFerron St.
Mt. Vernon, KY
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Wed. Night 7 p.m.
Sunday School 2 p.m.

Sunday Worship 3 p.m.
Pastor: Fred Hecker

Hickory Grove
Pentecostal Church

Hwy. 1505 (6 miles from Brodhead)
Brodhead,Ky.

Randal Adams, Pastor
Youth Pastor, Scott Adams

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.

Lighthouse Assembly of God
Hwy. 1004 • Orlando, Ky.

Tim Hampton, Pastor
606-256-4884 • 606308-2342

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Tues. Night Intercessory Prayer 7 p.m.
Wednesday Night Bible Study 7 p.m.

Little Country Church
Jarber Rd.

Turn left off Rev. Green Loop
onto Jarber Rd.

Jack Weaver, Pastor
Sunday 6 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.

Livingston Baptist Church
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Adult & Youth Classes Available
Worship Service 11 a.m.

Wednesday Bible Study & Meeting
7 p.m.

Bro. Steve McKinney, Pastor
606-758-4097

email: stevemc64@alltel.net

Livingston Pentecostal
Holiness Church

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Jim Miller, Pastor
606-256-1709

Maple Grove Baptist Church
Hwy. 1004 (Big Cave Road)

Orlando, Ky. 40460
606-256-1873

Bro. Jerry Owens, Pastor
 Home Phone 606-256-3075

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship 11 a.m.

WRVK Broadcast 2 p.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.

Maretburg Baptist Church
2617 New Brodhead Rd.
Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
Wayne Harding, Pastor

 Phone: 256-8844
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Discipleship Training

6 p.m.
Sunday Youth Missions 6 p.m.

Sunday Evening Worship 7 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
www.maretburgbaptist.org

maretburgchurch@yahoo.com

McNew Chapel Baptist
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Jerry Ballinger, Pastor

Mt. Vernon Church of God
1025 W Main St.

Mount Vernon, Ky.
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Bobby Owens, Pastor
859-986-1317

Mt. Vernon Church of the
Nazarene

40 Fair Street • Mt. Vernon
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wallace Thornton, Sr., Pastor

New Hope Baptist Church
Jct. 1797 New Hope Tower Rd. Orlando

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Bro. David Carpenter, Pastor

Northside Baptist Church
777 Faith Mountain Rd.

(Off 461 bypass) Mt. Vernon
606-256-5577

www.nbcnet.org
Sunday

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Hispanic Services 4 p.m.
Evening Worship 6 p.m.

Wednesday
Adult & Youth Worship 7 p.m.

WLJC-TV 65 (Dish Network and
regional TV cables)
Thursday 8:30 p.m.

New Wave Cable (KET2 ch. 3)
Tues., Thurs., Sun.

9 a.m., 2 p.m., 7 p.m.
Pastor: Bro. Chad Burdette

Youth Pastor: Bro. Jon Burdette
Hispanic Strategist: Bro. Ken Roberts
Minister of Music: Bro. Tony Renner

Ottawa Baptist Church
1074 Ottawa Rd. • Brodhead

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Discipleship Training/
Youth Mission Groups 6 p.m.

Wednesday Services
Youth Choir 6 p.m.

Children’s & Youth Bible Study
6:45 p.m. • Service 7 p.m.

Jim Craig, Pastor • 758-8453
ottawabaptist@windstream.net

Our Lady of Mt. Vernon
Catholic Church

515 Williams St.
(across from MVES)

Mount Vernon, Ky. 606-256-4170
Mass Times:

Tuesdays at 5 p.m.
Sabbath Mass: Sat., 5 p.m.

Holy Days 5 p.m.
Father Nick Pagano, Pastor

Sister Joyce Moeller,
Pastoral Associate

Philadelphia United
Baptist Church

834 Bryant Ridge Rd.
Brodhead, Ky.

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Saturday Service 7 p.m.
Gordon Mink, Pastor

606-256-9724

Pine Hill Holiness Church
5216 S. Wilderness Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456
Allen Hensley, Pastor

453-4801
www.pinehillholinesschurch.com

email: pinehillhc@aol.com
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Evening Worship 7 p.m.
Thursday Night Worship 7:30 p.m.
Saturday Night Worship 7:30 p.m.

WRVK (1460 AM) Broadcast
Noon Sundays

Pine Hill Missionary
Baptist Church

81 Limeplant Hollow Road
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456

Contact: Casey McClure
606-308-4570

email: jcmclure@aol.com
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Discipleship Training 5:30 p.m.
Sunday Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday Prayer Meeting and
Youth Service at 7:00 p.m.

Prayer Partners Ladies Meeting
monthly every second Tuesday

at 6:30 p.m.

Poplar Grove Baptist
145 Richlands Rd. • Brodhead
Bro. Jimmy Perkins, Pastor

606-355-2734
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.

Providence
church of Christ

1 mile off Hwy. 70 on Hwy. 618
Dan McKibben, Minister

758-8524 or 758-9316
Sunday Bible Study 10 a.m.

Sunday Morning Worship 10:30 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.
email: dan.mckibben@juno.com

www.WhatSaithTheScriptures.com

Rose Hill Church
Pastor: Bobby Barnett
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

Roundstone Baptist Church
Rick Reynolds, Pastor

606-758-8095
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Sand Springs Baptist Church
Directions: Take Hwy 1249, go
exactly 5 miles, church on right

Bob Bradley, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7:00 p.m.

Scaffold Cane Baptist
Chris Cobb, Pastor

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.

Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Union Chapel
Pentecostal Church
1505 Union Chapel Rd.

Brodhead, Ky.
Ralph Reynolds, Minister

606-355-2638
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7:00 p.m.

Thursday Evening 7:00 p.m.

Wildie Christian Church
1478 Wildie Rd.  • Wildie

606-256-4494
Kenton Parkey, Minister
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 10:55 a.m.
Family Fellowship 6 p.m.

Wednesday Nite Cafe 5:15 p.m.
Bible Study 6 p.m.

Protect Your Car This Winter!

We now sell
Eagle Carports

Soft Top Savings Celebration

Get up to $100 back on a
Bestop Soft Top

Check us out at www.bishoptire.com

SEE OUR SPECIALS AT
WWW.NEARNEWAUTO.COM

Radio
Shack

Located inside Napa
260 Main St.
Mt. Vernon

606-256-2147
606-256-5821

Digital Converter
Boxes Now at
Radio Shack

Is your TV ready
for Digital?

Only $23.59 after $40.00
government coupon.

To receive your coupons
call 1-888-388-2009.

Church news deadline is Noon Tuesday

To add your church to our
directory please call

256-2244
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In attendance at Sunday’s services at Chestnut Ridge were
Dusty McClure with children, Addison and Maddus.

Donnie Robbins helped lead the singing at Chestnut Ridge
Church of Christ on Sunday.

Many people braved the bad weather on Sunday morning
to attend worship services at the Chestnut Ridge Church
of Christ, including, Harold and Lynn Hamilton, shown
above.

Chestnut Ridge Church of Christ member Marvin Wilson
read scripture during Sunday’s Worship Service.

Mrs. Eva Wheat, shown in the wheelchair at right, who is
in her 90s, is the oldest member of the Chestnut Ridge
Church of Christ. She is the sister of Albert and Amos
Owens, who are both deceased and who were preachers
for several years at the Church. At left is Mrs. Mattie
Wheat, also a longtime member of the church. The ladies
are sisters-in-law.

Table. He takes bread (unleav-
ened) and gives thanks, breaks
off his portion and eats, and
then each other Christian also
partakes in the same way. Then
he takes a cup containing the
fruit of the vine (grape juice),
expresses thanks, drinks a por-
tion and then gives it to the
other communicants who also
drink. This is a joint participa-
tion in the body and blood of
Jesus, a memorial of His great
sacrifice on the cross (Matt. 26:
26-28; Luke 22: 17-20; I Cor.
11:26). Thus, we follow the
simple patter given us in the
Bible.

The only service in which a
collection is taken is on the first
day of the week (I Cor. 16:1,2)
in the Lord’s Day worship ser-
vice. At this time the members
of the church are permitted to
give of their means as the Lord
has blessed them, purposing in
their own hearts how much to
give (II Cor. 9:7,8). These con-
tributions are for the work of
the church. No one but a mem-
ber of the church is expected
to give.

At each service, an invita-
tion is extended to all that are
not Christians to obey the Gos-
pel and become followers of
Christ (Rev. 22:17, II Thes.
1:8). The backsliders, likewise,
are also urged to return to the
Lord (Gal. 6:1, Jas. 5:19, I John
1:9). This is done in such a way
so as not to embarrass those
present, but to allow anyone the
opportunity to obey the Lord.

We wear the name “Chris-
tian” as disciples of Christ
(Act. 11:26; 4:12), and we un-
derstand that those who obey
the gospel are added to the
church by the Lord) Act. 2:47).
Christ we honor as the head of
the church and the savior of the
body (Col. 1:18, Eph. 5:23).

Bell - Ingram
Jenna March Bell and Brandon Tyler Ingram, along with

their parents, announce their engagement and forthcoming
marriage.

The bride-to-be is the daughter of Ralph and Regina Bell.
The prospective groom is the son of Jeff and Janice Ingram.

The wedding is at 2:30 p.m. February 7, 2009 at Russell
Acton Folk Center in Berea with a reception to follow.

All friends and relatives are invited to attend.

TOPS Meetings
TOPS #KY 0476 are held

Thursdays 6 to 6:30 p.m.
(weigh-in/meeting times)at
Brodhead Christian Church,
Hwy. 150 W and Main St.,
lower level.

Gospel Singing
There will be a gospel sing-

ing at Crossroads Assembly of
God, on Hwy. 150, Brodhead,
Sunday, January 25th, starting
at 6 p.m. Come and join us.
Food and fellowship after the
service.

Lost Souls Crusade
Brush Creek Holiness

Church is holding a Lost Souls
Crusade - Winning Souls for
Jesus! The crusade will be Fri-
day night, January 23rd at 7
o’clock with special preaching
by Bro. Allen Hensley.

The sole purpose of this cru-
sade is for the lost souls who
have not accepted Jesus as their
Lord and Savior to come to
know Him. We will be sharing
the gospel through singing, tes-
timony and the Word.

Please be sure to invite all
your family, friends and neigh-
bors to this special service.

For more info, e-mail

www.pinehillholinesschurch.com
or pinehillhc@aol.com or call
606-453-4801 or 606-256-
3228.

Special Singing
There will be a special sing-

ing with the Doan Family at the
Lighthouse Baptist Church at
1391 Gabbardtown Rd. in
Berea on Saturday, February
14th beginning at 7 p.m.

Cards of
Thanks

Thank You
Thanks to the kindness and

concern of the people of Mt.
Vernon, the black and white
Sheltie, lost on Hwy. 150, has
been returned safe and sound.
Thank you and God bless you
all.

The Sowder Family

Ruby Allen
A very special thank you

from the family of the late Ruby
J. Roberts Allen to those who
sent cards, flowers, food and
the love and kindness shown us
in our time of sorrow.

To Dowell and Martin Fu-
neral Home, Bro. Ray Cowan
for his kind words, Dr. G.W.
Griffith and staff for their years
of care giving and to everyone
at Rockcastle Health and Re-
hab Center for the loving care,
kindness and respect they gave
our mother these last four years.
We are truly thankful to every-
one.

Glen and Virginia Roberts
Rose Ann Roberts

Rader - French
Ashley Nicole Rader and David Dean French were united

in marriage October 30, 2008. The couple now resides in Or-
lando.

Chestnut Ridge
Church of Christ

(Cont. from A6)

Photos by: Richard Anderkin
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Cystic Fibrosis fundraiser
features Bluegrass Night

“A Rockin’ Bluegrass
Night” Cystic Fibrosis
Fundraiser, in honor of
Rockcastle County’s CF survi-
vors and In Memory of
Suzanne Graves, will be held
on Saturday, January 31st at the
Rockcastle County High
School auditorium.

Featured act will be the Wild
River Bank and special “Blue-
grass” guests will be Boundary
Line and Music Maker (a na-
tional touring act).

The show begins at 7 p.m.
(doors open at 6:30) and tick-
ets are $10 and $5 for students
(student tickets may be pur-
chased at schools only).

For tickets or more informa-
tion, contact: Dana Cash, 606-
308-3057; Tammy Miller 256-
5118; Billy Reynolds 256-
2730; Music Hall of Fame 256-
1000; Charlie Napier 758-
8993; James Miller 256-2178
or Bentley Cromer 606-521-
7061

Happy New Year
Everybody!

I’m Jared Nicolas Blake
Barron. I was born Sep-
tember 30, 2008. My
mommy and daddy are
Danielle and Robbie
Barron and my big sister
is Jasmine. My grandpar-
ents are Dale and James
Miller, Daniel and Crystal
Sowder, Susan and Greg
Ellison and Larry and
Linda Barron. My great
grand-maws are Mattie
Hasty, Janie Sowder and
Margie Barron. Thanks
everybody for all the hugs,
kisses and love!

Hi, my name is Christian
James Kimsey and I came
into this world on Novem-
ber 16, 2008. I weighed 7
lbs. 13 ozs. and was 19 3/4
inches long. My mommy
and daddy are Jr. and Jen-
nifer Kimsey of Mt.
Vernon. My proud grand-
parents are George and
Barbara Dooley of Mt.
Vernon and Billie White of
Potsdam, OH. I would like
to say hi to all of my family
and a special hello to my
Aunt Ruby and family in
Kewanne, IL. Hope to see
you soon!

Tim Saylor and Jennifer
Napier would like to an-
nounce the birth of their
child, Brooklyn Paige.
Brooklyn was born August
30, 2008. Brooklyn is the
granddaughter of Francis
Saylor and the great
granddaughter of Helen
Powell Saylor. She is also
the granddaughter of
Brenda Dixon and Dean
Napier and the grand-
daughter of the late Irvine
Saylor.

We would like to congratu-
late Brandy Owens for her
academic achievement of
making the Dean’s List at
the University of Kentucky
during the 2008 fall semes-
ter. Brandy is the daughter
of Clarence and Martha of
Orlando and graduated in
the 2008 Rockcastle County
High School class. Brandy is
currently majoring in El-
ementary Education and
maintained a 3.5 gpa
throughout the semester.

We are so proud of your
hard work!

Love - Mom, Dad, Mike
and Christy, Christopher

Six full blooded Lab Puppies
The above three-month-old pup is among the dogs and pups
up for adoption at the Rockcastle Animal Shelter on Deep
Hollow Road, off Old Sigmon Road, at Roundstone. Above,
Animal Shelter Director James Kidwell holds one of six full
blooded Lab pups from the same litter, which are now up for
adoption at the shelter. The adoption fee is $20. The animal
shelter is open Monday through Friday from 8 a.m. to 4 p.m.,
except for Tuesday when it is closed from noon to 2 p.m. For
more information call (606) 256-1833 or go online at
www.pets911.com.

January 13-19, 2009
Tuesday, January 13th

Dispatched to a single ve-
hicle accident in which the ve-
hicle had rolled over and was
resting on its top.  The accident
was on Hwy 25 south just south
of Burr.  Nine firefighters re-
sponded.  Upon arrival, all oc-
cupants were out of vehicle.

Wednesday, January 14th
Dispatched to a fire alarm

activation at Mount Vernon
Plumbing.  Six firefighters re-
sponded in two engines.  Upon
arrival, found no fire, a small
amount of smoke from burnt
food had activated alarm.

Fire units were requested at
a residence to inspect a wood
burning stove.  Homeowner
advised he wished for fire units
to inspect stove and to ensure
it would vent properly before
he began using it.

Received report of fire
alarm activation at Renfro Val-
ley.  Eight firefighters re-
sponded, searched buildings in
area and found no fire.

Friday, January 16th
Dispatched to Jeans Restau-

rant on Hwy. 1004 to a reported
grease fire in kitchen area.
Seven firefighters responded.
Upon arrival, workers had ex-
tinguished fire using an extin-
guisher.  Searched entire
kitchen for further fire damage,
found none.  Advised workers
to get stove cleaned and in-
spected before using again due
to fire and fire extinguisher
chemicals.

Dispatched to vehicle fire at
exit 59.  Nine firefighters re-
sponded with two pumpers.
Upon arrival, observed a
minivan with a heavy amount

of fire in engine compartment
and dash area.  Extinguished
fire with approximately 500
gallons of water.  Due to ex-
tremely low temperature, wa-
ter used to extinguish fire froze
immediately on contact with
road surface.  For that reason,
I-75 remained closed until salt
trucks arrived to treat area.

Saturday, January 17th
Received report of grass fire

at Hummel behind Renfro Val-
ley. Seven firefighters re-
sponded with pumper and
tanker.  Upon arrival, observed
approximately one acre of
grass on and brush on fire.  Ex-
tinguished fire before it could
spread to woods.

Sunday, January 18th
Dispatched to a two vehicle

accident on I-75 at mile marker
70.  Eight firefighters re-
sponded.  Upon arrival, ob-
served one vehicle resting on
its top.  Used Jaws of Life to
extricate patient. Assisted
Mount Vernon Police Dept.
with traffic control.

Received report of a single
vehicle accident on Blue
Springs Rd.  Eight firefighters
responded.  Upon arrival ob-
served a small pick up over
embankment.  Patient was not
trapped.  Assisted EMS with
loading patient.

Dispatched to a single ve-
hicle accident over an embank-
ment on Big Cave Road.  Eight
firefighters responded.  Upon
arrival, observed a single ve-
hicle resting on its wheels over
an embankment.  Driver was
out of vehicle.  Rescue units
remained on scene, assisted
with traffic control while ve-
hicle was removed.

Mt. Vernon Fire and
Rescue Activity Report

Central Body Service
275 Richmond Street - Mt. Vernon

Precision
Collision - Repair
Quality Work Since 1966
Free Estimates - All Work Guaranteed

606-256-4210
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Rocket junior Matt Bullens goes up for two of his team
high 24 points against Wayne County on Tuesday night.
Bullens hit a three point shot to send the game into over-
time and he also made the winning basket in overtime.

Lady Rocket
JV update

The following is an update
on the RCHS Girl's Junior Var-
sity team from the past week.

The Lady Rockets played
Clay County close last Monday
night on the road, but in the end
they lost 32-22.

Sydney Arvin led the team
in scoring with 9, Ella
McQueary had 7, Michaela
Hunter and Cheyenne Hensley
each had 2, and Shanlee Bur-
ton and Kristin Abney scored 1
each.

On Tuesday night the Lady
Rockets would pick up a win
against Somerset, 42-25. They
were led in scoring by Angie
Lawrence with 13. Kristen
Abney got 7, Sydney Arvin 5,
Shanlee Burton 4, Alexis
Chasteen 3 and Katie Cowan,
Michaela Hunter, Cheyenne
Hensley, Ella McQueary and
Casey Sturgill 2 each.

Last Thursday, the JVs won
a close one against Southwest-
ern 37-30. Shanlee Burton led
all scorers with 10, Casey
Sturgill had 7, Bre Tillary 5,
Cheyenne Hensley and Sydney
Arvin had 4 each, Ella
McQueary 3 and Michaela
Hunter and Alexis Chasteen 2.

Last Friday night, the Lady
Rockets picked up a win
against Whitley 43-35.

Sydney Arvin and Angie
Lawrence led all scorers with
9 each, Ella McQueary got 7,
Shanlee Burton and Cheyenne
Hensley 4 each, Kristin Abney
3, Casey Sturgill and Michaela
Hunter  2 each and Bre Tillary
1.

Update for
Rocket JV

Friday night, the boys’ JV
team played Knox Central
close, but would  wound up o
n the short end of the 43-35
score.

Dakota Mahaffey led his
team in scoring with 12, Travis
Carpenter got 8, Grant Burdette
and Derrick Pittman each had
4, Kyle Riddle 3, and Matt
Lunsford and John Lawson got
2 each.

The Rockets faced Lincoln
County on Saturday and again
would keep the contest close,
but would fall 46-36.

Travis Carpenter had a good
game with 15, Matt Lunsford
scored 7, Grant Burdette and
John Lawson had 4 each, Der-
rick Pittman 3, Kyle Riddle got
2 and  Dakota Mahaffey 1.

Last Tuesday at Southwest-
ern the JV lost  64-30.

Grant Burdette led all scor-
ers on the night with 8, Matt
Lunsford had 5, Travis Carpen-
ter, Josh McKinney, and John
Lawson scored 4 each, Derrick
Pittman and Dakota  Mahaffey
2 each and Kyle Riddle had 1.
The Junior Varsity team is now
3-6 on the season.

Boys’ freshmen
still without win

At a freshman tournament
played at Rocky Hollow last
week, the Rocket's played hard
against Pulaski but would
ended up losing 46-35.

The freshmen were led in
scoring by Will Reynolds with
11. Ben Lake scored 10, Jadon
Brock 7, Zach  Walker 4, Jor-
dan Whitaker 2 and Cody Noe
1.

That same day, the Rockets
faced Somerset, and lost  43-
31. Ben Lake led the ROCK in
scoring with 10, followed by
Cody Noe and Jadon Brock
each with 6, Zach Walker
scored 3 and Zach Reams and
Jordan Kelley  had 2 each.

Next up the Rockets faced
Casey County and again played
a close game, but fell 40-33.
Jadon Brock led the team in

Sophomore Angie Lawrence goes for two of her eight points
against Whitley County on Friday night. The Lady Rock-
ets won the varsity game 67-29. The junior varsity beat
Whitley County, 43-35. Lawrence had 9 in that game.

The Rockcastle County
High School Rockets boys bas-
ketball team hosted Wayne
County on Tuesday night and
the fans certainly got their
money’s worth, as the Rockets
won in overtime, 70-69.

 Wayne County led most of
the game but were unable to put
the Rockets away, winding up
in an overtime battle after a 60
all score at the end of regula-
tion.

In the second half the Rock-
ets fought their way back to
take the lead for the first time
in the game late in the third
quarter.

The lead changed hands
several times throughout the
fourth quarter  with Wayne
County holding a three point
lead with 10 seconds left in
regulation.

After a Wayne County de-
fender tipped the ball out of
bounds  there was time for one
last shot. Dustin Reynolds
threw the ball in to Matt
Bullens who took a couple of
dribbles and hit a game-tying
3-pointer at the buzzer to knot
the game at 60 and send it into
overtime.

In overtime, the lead again

changed multiple times and,
again, the Rockets  found
themselves down, but this time
by only 1 point.

With 3.3 seconds left in
overtime and the Rockets down
69-68,  Matt Bullens grabbed
an offensive rebound and
nailed the put back. A foul was
called on the play but Bullens
missed the free throw, giving
Wayne County one more pos-
session. When Wayne County
attempted to inbound the ball
Senior Spencer Mullins broke
up the pass and the game was
over.

The win improved the
Rockets record to 9-10 on the
year.

Besides his game tying and
game winning shots, Matt
Bullens also led the Rockets in
scoring with 24.

Jamie Todd added 16, Spen-
cer Mullins 15, Bryan Clontz
8, Dustin Reynolds 5 and jun-
ior Derek Thacker had 4.

Last Friday night the Rock-
ets faced a tough Knox Central
squad on the road and kept it
close throughout, but fell short
72-64.

Host Casey County on Friday night

Rockets defeat
Wayne in OT

Last  Friday, the  Rockcastle
County High School Lady
Rockets hosted Whitley
County  and easily defeated
them 67-29.

Head coach Chrysti Noble
was able to substitute early,
with ten players getting into the
scoring column.

Sophomore Center Sara
Hammond had another impres-
sive night leading the Lady
Rockets in scoring with 16, but
was followed closely by senior
Mary Saylor with 15 points.

Angie Lawrence and Nicole
Locklear scored 8 each, Jackie
Alexander got 7, Ashley
Robinson 4, Jillisa Lay 3 and
Kristin  Abney, Cheyenne
Hensley and Shanlee Burton all
had 2.

The  Lady Rockets then
played host to Wayne County,
a team they defeated by only
two points in the first game of
the season, on Tuesday night
and found themselves in a close
contest early on.

After the first quarter of
play, the Lady Rockets only led
by 3. However, the Rockets
found their stride in the second

quarter and were ahead by 13
at the break.

The Lady Rockets would go
on to win their 15th game of
the year, 51-36 over Wayne and
are now to 15-4 on the season.

The starters for the Lady
Rockets played throughout the
game due to Wayne County's
ability  to keep the game com-
petitive and not allow the
Rockets to pull away.

The Lady Rockets were led
in scoring by junior Jackie
Alexander who had 15 on the
evening. Hammond was the
only other player to get into
double figures  with 10, Angie
Lawrence had 8, Ashley
Robinson and Mary Saylor
each had 6, and Katy Mattingly,
Kritin Abney and Jillisa Lay all
had 2.

The Lady Rockets are
ranked second in the state this
week and first in the 12th re-
gion in the Lexington Herald-
Leader’s poll.

They will host Casey
County on Friday night in a
doubleheader district matchup
with the boys’ team.

Ranked second in state

Lady Rockets
win two more

Rocket senior Jarred Smith looks for an open teammate
in Tuesday night’s 70-69 overtime win over Wayne County.
Smith had two points on the night.

Rocket senior Spencer Mullins puts up a three pointer in
the Rocket’s overtime victory over Wayne County on Tues-
day night. Mullins scored 15 points in the contest. The
Rockets host Casey County in a doubleheader with the
Lady Rockets on Friday night.

RCHS senior Mary Saylor puts up a three point shot in the
Lady Rocket’s 67-29 win over Whitley County on Friday
night. Saylor, who has been very consistent this season, had
15 points on the night. The Lady Rockets are ranked sec-
ond in the state this week  in the Lexington Herald-Leader’s
high school poll. (Sports photos by Kevin Canterbury).

scoring with 11, Cody Noe had
9, Ben Lake 8, Will Reynolds
and Jordan Whitaker each had
2 and  Zach Walker got 1.

The Rockets played Lincoln
in the final game of the day and
lost 56-22. Ben Lake led the
scoring for the Rockets with 7,
Cody Noe had 4, Jordan
Whitaker 3 and Jadon Brock,
Will Reynolds, and Zach
Walker each had 2.

The Freshmen  are now 0-
10 on the season.

(Cont. to A11)

Lady Rocket Shanlee Burton puts up a shot in the junior
varsity game against Whitley County last Friday night.
The JV won, 43-35. Burton had four points in the game.

RCMS Boys Basketball
Events Rescheduled

The RCMS boys basketball team is selling tickets for a “Rocket
Throw.” The price is $1 per chance.

The drawing will be held on January 22nd.
The RCMS boys basketball team will also be hosting a Chili

Supper on January 22nd, Eighth Grade Night.
The price is $5, which includes a bowl of chili, drink, sandwich

and dessert. The supper will begin at 4 p.m. and will end at
halftime of the 7th grade game.



The Rockcastle girls' track and field teams competed at the Mason County indoor meet
this past Saturday, their first competition of the season. The RCMS girls' team dominated
the competition, winning by 54 points over Mason County and Fairland Middle of Cincin-
nati.  Junior Samantha Smith won all three of her events for the RCHS girls'  team.  Team
members present included, front from left: Kira Deatherage, Samantha Smith, Sarah
McKinney and Brooklyn Blanton. Second row from left: Alyssa Allen, Bryonna Cromer,
Gabby Miller, Kendra Dees, April Mason, Kaci Bussell, Bridget Pittman and Amber
Woodall. Third row from left: Emma Evans, Leah Woodall, Krystal Smith, Ashley Baggett,
Danielle McNew, Heather Holden, Rachel Cain, Alyssa Cox, Tanika Chasteen, Eliza Ma-
son, Kristen Brown, Kayla Cromer and Ileana Miller. Back row from left: Tori Phillips,
Victoria Smith, Amy Johnson, Alexis Stewart, September Miller, Holly Bradley, Cheyenne
Gilliam, Cynthia Deaton, Lauren Reopelle and Lacey Gastineau.  Not pictured - Ashley
Newland.
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Brodhead
606-758-8212
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606-287-8390

Matt Bullens led the team in
scoring with 19 points fol-
lowed by Spencer Mullins with
15, Jamie Todd 14, Bryan
Clontz and Derek Thacker 7
each and Jarred Smith 2.

The Rockets will host Casey
County on Friday night in a
doubleheader with the Lady
Rockets.

The Rockets defeated Casey
County on January 2nd, 62-38
in a game played at Casey
County.

The Rockets are currently
ranked number one in the 47th
district with a record of 3-1.

Casey County has a district
record of 2-3 and 5-12 overall.

The first game at RCHS on
Friday night is at 6:30 p.m.

Fish Fry
North Atlantic Cod

Lil’s Place
Main St. • Livingston

Saturday, January 24th
Begins at 2 p.m.

Everyone Welcome

The RCHS and RCMS
girls’ track teams got their sea-
sons underway this past Satur-
day at the first indoor meet of
the season hosted by Mason
County High School. A couple
of teams from Cincinnati, Ohio
were also on hand for the com-
petition.

The RCHS girls’ team only
fielded three competitors for
the meet and did not bring any
distance runners with them.
The trio was also limited to just
a few events for their first com-
petition.

Junior all-state athlete
Samantha Smith picked up
right where she left off last out-
door season. Samantha totally
dominated all competitors in
her events.  She easily won the
55-meter dash with a very fast
early season time of 7.81 sec-
onds. She also captured 1st
place in long jump by over two
feet with an amazing leap of
15'7".  Samantha’s best perfor-
mance came in the triple jump
competition where she easily
won with an awesome effort of
33'9", winning by nearly eight
feet over her nearest competi-

tor.
Senior all-state athlete Sarah

McKinney finished 2nd in the
55-meter hurdles with an awe-
some time of 9.65 seconds, de-
spite spraining an ankle during
the middle of the race.

Eighth grader Amy Johnson
won the shot put competition
by an amazing two feet over her
nearest competitor.  She threw
an impressive 26'4", a major
improvement from her first
competition a year ago.

Despite having only three
girls in limited events, the team
placed 4th and would have eas-
ily won first place with their
full team.

The girls’ team will be seek-
ing their 3rd straight indoor
state championship title this
March when they attempt to
defend their Class 2A champi-
onship from two years ago.
Last year’s state championships
were cancelled due to the huge
snow that took place in Louis-
ville during that time, denying
RCHS an opportunity for their
3rd state title.

The RCMS girls’ team had
plenty of competitors to cover

all the events at Mason County.
With 33 team members on
hand out of 45 that are pres-
ently on the team, the girls had
little trouble dominating the
competition, winning by an im-
pressive 54 points.  RCMS had
several finish in the top ten in
their respective events, but
only the top two competitors
from each team counted in the
scoring.

Sixth grader Kira
Deatherage dominated the 55-
meter dash, winning with an
awesome time of 8.37 seconds.
eighth grader Bryonna Cromer
also scored, placing 3rd in a
fast 8.67 seconds.

Kira also took home 1st
place honors in the 400-meter
dash, easily winning in an im-
pressive 1:13.83. Seventh
grader Lacey Gastineau placed
2nd overall with a great effort
of 1:15.44.

In the 800-meter run, sixth
grader Alyssa Cox placed 4th
overall with an exceptional ef-
fort of 3:15.02. Sixth grader
Rachel Cain finished 7th over-
all in an impressive 3:30.94.
Rachel also finished 4th in the

Smith places first in three events

Girls’ indoor track teams
compete at Mason County

Tim Robinson, of Burr, got the thrill of a lifetime re-
cently when he was able to separate two deer that
were still alive and had been hooked together for ap-
proximately eight hours at the Bluegrass Army De-
pot. Tim got help separating the deer from Cecil
Parrish. Both deer were able to walk away after be-
ing separated but, unfortunately, one of the deer was
found dead later.

Healthcare Webmaster

Rockcastle Hospital and Respiratory Care Center,

Inc. is seeking a healthcare webmaster to help build

and manage a dynamic new Web site. For job

description, log on to www.rockcastlehospital.org.

Email resume to a.reese@rhrcc.org.

Rockcastle Hospital and Respiratory Care Center,

Inc. is a not-for-profit community hospital that oper-

ates inpatient and outpatient acute care programs,

79 long-term care beds for ventilator-dependent

patients, a home health care service and Medical

Arts Building. 

The hospital was established in 1956, is accredited

by the Joint Commission on Accreditation of

Healthcare Organizations (JCAHO), and treats

patients from across Kentucky and several other

states. 

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER

145 Newcomb Avenue • Mt. Vernon, KY 40456 • Ph (606) 256-2195 • Fax (606) 256-3232

1600-meter run with an awe-
some time of 7:12.59.

Seventh grader Alyssa Allen
ran a spectacular race in the 55-
meter hurdles, winning with a
time of 11.22 seconds.

Sixth grader Cynthia
Deaton took home 1st place in
the shot put competition, plac-
ing 1st with a great throw of
23'11".

Eighth grader Brooklyn
Blanton won the long jump
competition with a great leap
of 12'4". Alyssa Allen took 2nd
overall with a terrific effort of
12'0".

RCMS dominated the final
event of the meet, the 1600-
meter relay.  The team of Lacey
Gastineau, Bryonna Cromer,
Alyssa Allen, and Kira
Deatherage won with an im-
pressive time of 5:09.65.

In a short amount of time,
the RCMS girls’ team has es-
tablished themselves as a
strong contender for the Ma-
son-Dixon Games Middle
School Indoor State Champi-
onship title this March. It looks
as if they may have as much
talent as any RCMS middle
school girls’ track team to date.

Next up for RCHS will be
the competitive University of
Kentucky Wildcat Classic this
Saturday. RCMS next com-
petes at Mason County on
January 31.

Subscribe to the Signal

“Rockets”
(Cont. from pg. A10)
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“Crash”
(Cont. from front)

Lick Road while both officers
turned around, engaged their
emergency equipment and fol-
lowed Cunningham’s vehicle.

They followed onto Fall
Lick Road (Highway 1972)
until their speed became unsafe
and they couldn’t keep
Cunningham in sight. Lake
slowed down and had decided
not to pursue but as he popped
over the hill  he was faced with
the smoldering collision.

Both officers simulta-
neously called 9-1-1 to report
the accident.

Brandon was on his way
home to play games with his
brother and share a steak din-
ner with his family when
Cunningham, traveling at a
high rate of speed, crossed the
center line of the roadway past
Windswept Drive in his wife’s
1992 Pontiac Grand Prix and
hit Brandon’s 2007 Chevrolet
pickup head on.

Hearing that an accident had
occurred on Fall Lick Road, the
Plummers tried to call Brandon
who failed to respond. They
then decided to go to the scene
where a friend eventually told
them Brandon was involved.

Mrs. Plummer was kept
away long enough for them to
remove her son from the
wreckage and stabilize him as
they waited for the helicopter.

He was coherent and alert
and she was able to hold his
hand and talk with him while
they waited but they wouldn’t
let her ride in the medi-evac
with him.

The family drove to the Uni-
versity of Kentucky hospital in
Lexington to find Brandon
fully alert. He told her that he
had prayed all the way. Al-
though his demeanor was that
of a man, handling the situation
without ever shedding a tear, he
told his mother that he didn’t
think he was going to survive.

She kissed him and they
shared “I love yous” before he
asked her to kiss his dog Dixie
and she heard his final words,
“Let’s roll.”

Carol Plummer reflected on
the day’s events, how she had
spent nearly an hour curled up
with her son on the bed watch-
ing a video from his psychol-
ogy class and how he had
shared with her that he wanted
to start going to church with
her. He told her that he had
been saved, the most important

words she needed to hear be-
fore her precious son left this
life.

Police said alcohol and ex-
cessive speed are suspected to
be contributing factors in the
accident. Toxicology reports
should be back within 10 work-
ing days, Garrard County
Coroner Daryl Hodge said.

Services for Cunningham,
who is survived by his wife,
Melinda and two sons, were
held Tuesday in Stanford.

A complete obituary ap-
pears on Page A-5 of this
week’s Signal.

providing much more support.
Carloftis said that Breathitt

County, with a population of
15,924 provides $252,000 a
year support to their sheriff’s
department out of a yearly bud-
get of approximately
$4,000,000, compared to
Rockcastle’s $4,757,394. The
judge/executive said that
Rockcastle’s budget would be
a lot higher if previous fiscal
courts had taken the 4% in-
crease allowed each year on
property taxes. “If Rockcastle
had kept their property tax rates
up over the last 60 years, the
sheriff’s department wouldn’t
have to be talking to the fiscal
court now -- but the services
have to be done,” Carloftis told
the court.

Carloftis also reminded the
court that the county would be
taking a hit financially in their
next budget from a decrease in
the amount of insurance tax
collected.

The Mt. Vernon City Coun-
cil voted last year to begin tak-
ing their portion of the tax. The
amount the county will collect
is not known yet since the State
Department of Insurance is
working on isolating property
within the city.

After much discussion, and
a motion by Magistrate John
Holbrook to provide funds for
an additional deputy, which
was later withdrawn for lack of
a second, the court approved
the sheriff’s budget, on a  mo-
tion by Magistrate Bill
McKinney, without an addi-
tional deputy. The court did tell
Peters that the matter would be
revisited after July 1st, the start
of the county’s fiscal year.

The budget approved for the
sheriff’s department shows ex-
pected revenues of $484,470
for 2009 and expected dis-

bursements of $483,902.
A look at expected revenues

for the sheriff’s office shows
that the bulk of his income is
from his commission on taxes
collected amounting to
$112,000. The revenue portion
of the budget also includes
$51,000 from fiscal court,
$60,670 from reimbursement
for Barry Adams, the local
DEA officer, $34,000 for reim-
bursement for bailiffs’ salaries
and $45,000 for accident/po-
lice reports and serving papers.
The $484,470 budget also in-
cludes a $53,000 bank loan to
the sheriff and $65,000 in a
state advance the sheriff gets
every year until he receives
enough revenue to run his of-
fice.

Major disbursements for
2009 include, $75,603 for the
sheriff’s salary (set by the
state), $164,129 for deputies,
full and part time, $67,270 for
supplemental pay to officers
from KLEFF and HIDTA,
which was taken as income and
has to be taken as a disburse-
ment which paid to the offic-
ers and $42,000 for gasoline.

County Clerk’s
Budget

Approval of County Clerk
Norma Houk’s budget took up
the majority of the special
meeting.

For the first time in many
years, the court reduced the cap
for employees’ salaries in
Houk’s office.

Last year, the cap was set at
$250,000 but was reduced to
$215,000 this year. Houk was
also asked to pay the
employer’s share of social se-
curity and provide $15,000 to-
ward the bill for the county’s
share of her employees’ retire-
ment.

It was a blow financially for
Houk’s office since, in calen-
dar year 2008, her gross pay-
roll was $237,368 for seven
employees, up from
$192,408.28 in 2007 and
$174,873.60 in 2006. During
2008, the county paid
$20,650.42 in matching social
security and $47,184.78 in
matching retirement.

Houk told the court that
their decision would mean that
she would have to cut salaries
or lay off an employee in order
to keep under the salary cap.

Carloftis pointed out that
there was a disparity between
salaries paid in Houk’s office
and other county offices. It was
noted that the least paid em-
ployees are workers at the de-

tention center  and 911 employ-
ees and the average salary for
county workers is $22,000 a
year. In 2009, three employees
in Houk’s office were paid an
average of $45,492 each,

Houk told the court that one
of the employees had been
working in the office for over
25 years, another for 17. She
also said that December sala-
ries were higher because of
workers having to fill in for
employees taking personal
days before the end of the year
in order not to lose them.

Carloftis commended Houk
on her office’s operation but
said the county was “trying to
scrape up money in the general
fund because we are going to
be shy.” He also pointed out
that it had been since July of
2007 since the jail, 911, road
department and workers in the
county judge’s office have had
a pay raise.

Houk’s budget shows total
receipts expected of
$2,444,900 with the highest
part of the revenue coming
from the tangible personal
property tax of $910,000;
$620,000 for usage tax and
$530,000 for licenses and
transfers.

Major disbursements in-
clude: $601,400 for the state’s
share of the usage tax,
$381,000 also to the state for
their share of the property tax
and $355,000 again to the state
for their share of licenses and
transfers.

The fiscal court will get
$61,000 from property tax,
$15,000 in delinquent taxes
and $28,500 for deed transfer
tax.

Disbursements of $430,000
will be paid to taxing districts
in the county, $77,647 for the
clerk’s gross salary, $3,600 for
the clerk’s expense allowance
and $215,000 for deputies
gross salaries.

In other action concerning
Houk’s office, the court voted
to pay $18,000 of the bill for
new equipment and for scan-
ning county records for index-
ing.

by UNITE detectives and other
arrests are possible, according
to the news release.

Also assisting at the scene
was Rockcastle County Con-
stable Dale Miller.

For more information about
Operation UNITE visit their
website address at
www.operationunite.org

580 days and, at an estimated
cost of $25 per person per day,
the cost to the county would
have been $14,500.

However, because of the
Rocket Docket, the inmates

the regional tournaments,” said
Noble.

The Lady Rockets are the
defending 12th region champs
and have made it to the Sweet
16 tournament four of the last
five seasons.

Friday night the Lady Rock-
ets will try to avenge their loss
to Casey County on January
2nd. The Lady Rockets scored
only 32 points, which was the
lowest of the season, in that 43-
32 loss in Liberty.

The Lady Rebels are 16-2
on the season and 3-1 in dis-
trict play, as are the Lady Rock-
ets. The winner of Friday
night’s game will be ranked
number one in the district.

The Rockets will also play
Casey County on Friday night
in the district double header.

The Rockets are now 9-10
on the season after Tuesday
night’s overtime win over
Wayne County and first place
in the district with a 3-1 record.

The Rockets defeated Casey
County in their first meeting on
January 2nd, 64-59.

The Rebels are 5-12 on the
season and 2-3 in district play.

The first game at RCHS on
Friday night begins at 6:30
p.m.

“Budgets”
(Cont. from front)

only stayed in the county jail
28 days, saving the county
$13,500 in the first week of the
pilot project.

The cost to the county for
the entire month for the pro-
gram is only $1,250, paid to the
commonwealth attorney’s of-
fice for administering the pro-
gram, producing a net savings
of $13,250 to the county.

“This is just the beginning
of the savings the local jail will
see,” Bartley told the court.
“There is no doubt this pro-
gram is going to benefit the
county.”

Under the program, offend-
ers, whom the county and com-
monwealth attorney’s offices
feel would not be a threat to
public safety, are offered a
chance to plea bargain the sen-
tence for their offense instead
of staying in jail, or posting a
high bond, for 90 days to six
months, sometimes eight
months, before their case is dis-
posed of by the conventional
process. During that 90 days to
six months, the jail doesn’t col-
lect anything for their upkeep
until their sentencing.

Bartley later told the Signal,
“We are not guaranteeing a
lower budget for the jail, just
one that will be better than it
could have been because of this
program.”

In the three cases disposed
of last Wednesday, Bullens was
charged with theft by unlawful
taking over $300. She pled
guilty to the charge and re-
ceived an 18 month sentence.

Wombles was charged with
operating a motor vehicle un-
der the influence of alcohol,
fourth offense and was sen-
tenced to one year imprison-
ment.

Deborde pled guilty to pos-
session of drug paraphernalia,
second offense and was re-
leased on supervised diversion.

“Docket”
(Cont. from front)

“Meth Lab”
(Cont. from front)

“Ranked”
(Cont. from front)

Office Hours Changed
Effective immediately, office hours for the City of
Mt. Vernon have been changed back to the original
time of 8 a.m. to 4 p.m.

Also, you may pay current bills at Community Trust
Bank in Mt. Vernon.

We apologize for any inconvenience this may have
caused anyone.

Mayor Clarice R. Kirby
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School dismissed twice because of winter weather

Temperature falls
below zero twice

Interstate closed in Rockcastle Saturday
night because of Black Ice

Don Jones, above, and
Jackie Wayne Weaver
will join the Mt. Vernon
City Council as the new-
est members next Mon-
day night.

Don Jones, one of two
new Mt Vernon city council
members for 2009-10, joined
more than 200 other state-
wide city officials and em-
ployees at the Kentucky
League of Cities Academy

New councilmember Don Jones
attends League of Cities Academy

held at the Embassy Suites
Hotel in Lexington, January
12-14.

"As a newly elected coun-
cil member I needed a thor-
ough understanding of the
basics of the legislative body.
KLC training was worth ev-
ery dollar and every second
that I gave to attend the acad-
emy.  I came away wishing
that all the city officers, in-
cluding the Mayor would at-
tend,” Jones said in a news
release.

 “The academy equips one
with essential information
along with specific tools to
gather more information be-
cause it is impossible to re-
tain all that is required of us.
With the training and the
contact information, I am
ready to begin,"  Jones said.

The City of Mt. Vernon is
a longtime member of the
Kentucky League of Cities.

Rockcastle County
School officials called off
school Tuesday because of
slick roads,  for only the third
time this school year.

Last Friday, school offi-
cials called school off, as did
most of the school systems in
the state, because of ex-
tremely cold weather.

Friday, the recorded low
temperature in the county
was minus 3 degrees and, on

Saturday, local weatherman
Bud Cox recorded a minus 2.

The high recorded
temperture in the past week
has been 39 last Wednesday.

So far in the past week,
snow has been recorded on
three different occasions,
each time less than a half
inch.

With Tuesday’s dismissal,
Rockcastle students will now
be in class until May 20th.

Old Man Winter has certainly made his prescence felt in Rockcastle County in the past week, with the temperature
falling below zero on two different days. Because of  those cold temperatures, even the smallest amount of snow
made roadways slick and hazardous. State and county road crews, shown above in the bottom photo, have done a
good job of keeping main roads, such as Hwy. 150 clear, but many side roads, such as Christmas Tree Lane, shown
in the top photo, have been snow covered at least three days this week including Tuesday, when school was called
off in the county for the third time this school year.

 Photos by:
Richard
Anderkin

Southbound I-75 was
closed for over three hours
in Rockcastle County on
Saturday because of black
ice, mainly at the 55 mile
marker,  commonly known
as “River Hill.”

State Police said they re-
routed motorists off the in-
terstate at Exit 59 on the
southbound side and at Exit
41 in Laurel County on the
northbound side.

Police said one crash,
near the 53 mile marker,
caused two other crashes,
one of which involved a
wrecker driven by Josh Th-
ompson of David’s Tire

Center.
Thompson said he was

pulling off the road to assist
the people in the first wreck
when a woman from Knox-
ville, TN, with two passen-
gers, hit the back of his
wrecker. Thompson said the
woman’s car was going
backwards and hit his
wrecker broadside.

Thompson said the colli-
sion totaled the woman’s
Jeep Liberty and sent one of
her passengers to the hospi-
tal.

Thompson said while he
was attempting to help the
family from Knoxville, two

other vehicles collided
about 200 feet away. “There
were six wrecked vehicles
a few hundred feet apart,”
Thompson said.

Not long after the three
wrecks, in virtually the
same place, police closed
the interstate. “It was just a
solid sheet of ice out there,”
Thompson said.

Thompson’s wrecker
sustained minimal damage
but had to be worked on
before he continued to use
it throughout the night.

Police reported no criti-
cal injuries from the numer-
ous wrecks.

Above, David Mink of Town Country Service Station, and below, Josh Thompson, of David’s
Tire Center, work to cleanup one of the many wrecks that occurred in Rockcastle County
on Saturday night and Sunday morning. The wreck occurred on southbound I-75 near the
70 mile marker of I-75 around 7 a.m. when a Lexus, being driven by a Pennsylvania man,
slammed into the Toyota Matrix, below, being driven by a man from Canada. Mt. Vernon
firefighters had to cut the Canada man from his vehicle after the wreck, which closed the
interstate for a short time. State police at London said they worked over 41 wrecks in their
service area which includes Rockcastle.

Our Email address has
changed!

Email us now at
mvsignal@windstream.net



$5,727.10 plus claimed due.
Deborah Martina Alcorn

vs. Virgil Alcorn, petition
for dissolution of marriage.

Cabinet for Health and
Family Services ex rel
Glenn Davidson vs.
Michelle Davidson, com-
plaint for child support and
medical support.

Bonnie Ellen Roark vs.
Ronnie Leon Roark, petition
for dissolution of marriage.

Lumber King Inc. vs.
Robert W. Shaver,
$33,230.82 plus claimed
due.

Tax Ease Lien Invest-
ments 1 LLC vs. Eric Smith,
et al, $2,201.60 plus claimed
due.

Wilder Enterprises, Inc.
vs. Carol Robinson,
$20,079.16 plus claimed
due. CI-00015
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News from the Rockcastle Courthouse

District
Court

District Civil
Suits

Circuit Civil
Suits

Deeds
Recorded

Massage Therapy Available
Massage covered by auto

accident and
Worker’s Comp. Ins.

Dr. Meyer is now a Humana
provider. Also covered is Auto
Insurance, Anthem Blue Cross

Blue Shield, CHA, UHC,
Medicare, Medicaid,

and many others.

We will verify coverage
for you!

Mt. Vernon
CHIROPRACTIC

Dr. Max Meyer
70 School St. • Mt. Vernon

606-256-1986

Dr. Max Meyer

Jan. 12-14, 2009
Hon. Kathryn G. Wood
Roger J. Baker: con-

trolled substance prescrip-
tion not in original container,
$100 fine and 90 days/pro-
bated 24 months on
condotiion.

Amanda N. Bullens: op-
erating vehicle subject im-

paired, 1st, $200 fine and
costs, $375 service fee, 30
day operator license suspen-
sion, ADE authorized and 30
days; operating on sus-
pended/revoked operators
license, 30 days/concurrent.

Amanda Kates: theft by
unlawful taking, 30 days/
concurrent.

 Whitney N. Vance: de-
tention and arrest of shoplift-
ing suspect, 90 days/pro-
bated 24 months.

Charles F. Ashcraft: oper-
ating on suspended/revoked
operators license, $100 fine
and costs; reckless driving,
$100 fine.

Johnny Bingham: fines/
fees due ($730), bench war-
rant (bw) issued for failure
to appear (fta).

Essie R. Frederick: reck-
less driving, $100 fine and
costs; failure to wear seat
belts, $25 fine.

Dustin S. Fryer: public in-
toxication, $100 fine and
costs.

Jordan T. Hays: public in-
toxication, $100 fine and
costs.

Michael K. Lantos: no
operators license in posses-
sion, $250 fine and costs.

Speeding: Timothy R.
Rothe, $30 fine and $133
costs; Jason B. Stewart, $56
fine and costs; Jackie R.
Harris, paid$133 total;
Nathon L. Anderson, license
suspended for fta.

William A. Cardwell: op-
erating motor vehicle under
influence of alcohol/drugs,
and other charges, bw issued
for fta.

Donna K. Hakola: fines/
fees due ($208), bw issued
for fta/5 days or payment.

Larry E. Hasty: operating
motor vehicle under influ-
ence of alcohol/drugs, $250
fine and costs, $375 service
fee, 30 day operator license
suspension, 2 days, ADE
authorized.

Dennis Turner: hunt/fish/
trap w/o license/permit/
stamp, $25 fine and costs.

David Duane Rust II:
theft by unlawful taking, bw
issued for fta/4 days in lieu
of fines.

Christopher L. King: pos-
session of marijuana, $100
fine and costs.

Dorothy B. Page: illegal
sale/give alcohol, dry terri-
tory, $250 fine and costs; il-
legal possession of alcohol
in dry territory, $250 fine.

Jose Perez: no operators/
moped license, $100 fine
and costs.

Phillip C. Saylore: no/ex-
pired registration plates,
proof of after-acquired, $25
fine/suspended on condition.

Tabitha L. Shepherd: op-
erating motor vehicle under
influence of alcohol/drugs,
$200 fine and costs, $325
service fee, 26 days sus-
pended operators license,
ADE authorized and 1 days
in jail.

James C. Spoonamore:
assault and alcohol intoxica-
tion, bw issued for fta.

Cabinet for Health and
Faily Services vs. Gary
Marler, complaint for medi-
cal supplies.

Flagstar Bank, FSB vs.
Robert Couch, III, et al,
$37,224.40 plus claimed
due.

Deutsche Bank National
Trust Co. vs. John Edwards,
$69,907.45 plus claimed
due.

Pinnacle Credit Services
LLC vs. Robert Neeley,

Asset Acceptance LLC
vs. Julie H. Dickinson,
$970.03 plus claimed due.

Midland Funding LLC
vs. Holly Phillips, $992.29
plus claimed due.

Midland Funding LLC
vs. Louis Payne, $928.42
plus claimed due. C-00007.

Marriage
Licenses

Brian D. Carter, property
in Rainbow Ridge Subdv., to
Melinda Carter. No tax

Gary and Agnes Faye
Wools and Jerry and Yvonne
Ison, property in Rockcastle
County, to Curtis and Dollie
Roberts. No tax.

Tammi Howard, property
in Rockcastle County, to
David and Opal Wilder. Tax
$2.

ACROSS

  1  KY county, site of
Cincinnati
International Airport

  6  Tiny toiler
  9  Not fresh
14  Bygone
15  Alma mater of

former NBC Pres.
Julian Goodman

16  Liberty, KY is this
county's seat

17  Provided
18  Fraternity letters
19  Still in play
20  KFC's "Colonel"
22  Garrard Co. native,

Grand Ole Opry
regular, 1942-1947

24  Ed.'s request
25  Common TVA

landscape change
found in KY

26  "Gotcha!"
29  Eastern music
31  Kentuckian Irvin

Cobb's famous
"Judge"

37  Mimics
39  Frontiersman

Crockett
41  Kentuckian,

clairvoyant Cayce
42  Oldest continuous

business of record
in KY

45  Atlantic, for one
46  Slippery
47  Utah lily
48  Mountain Arts __,

Prestonsburg, KY
50  Bridge feat
52  Decade
53  Promos
55  P.I., e.g.
57  County where the

first KY State

Legislature met
62  Former

broadcaster,
Kentucky Athletic
Hall of Famer Wes

66  Kentuckian James
Bowie commanded
there

67  School org.
69  Thin pancake
70  City on the Po
71  Springs in Johnson

Co., Valley in
Wayne

72  Receded
73  File
74  Cable channel
75  Kentucky Derby;

"Run for the __"

DOWN

  1  Hard knocks
  2  Stewpot
  3  Thor's father
  4  Must-haves
  5  Win over
  6  Barley beards
  7  KY's youngest

state univ.
  8  Former Murray St.

and UK professor,
noted ceramic
sculptor

  9  Glance over
10  Toiletry item
11  China setting
12  Laurel Co. site, __

Jackson State
Park

13  Regarded
21  Anderson Co.

spot,
Rough-and-__

23  Rascal
25  Natives of this

KY county
include former
governor

Wendell Ford
26  Disorder
27  With speed
28  Kentuckian, White

House
correspondent
Thomas

30  Yielded
32  Ump
33  Midmonth day
34  "Snowy" bird
35  Boot camp boss
36  Check for fit
38  Bed support
40  Shout
43  Wind dir.
44  Law officer Earp
49  Rodent
51  County that is the

site of first
permanent pioneer
settlement in KY

54  Lexington
Bluegrass Army __

56  Energy source: Var.
57  Destiny
58  Reunion goer
59  Nimble
60  Mideast ruler
61  Former UK Wildcat

Delk
62  This product 

manufactured in KY
as early as 1793

63  Young socialites
64  Fencing sword
65  Cincy baseball

team
68  Food container

Lou Ann Griffin, 24,
Somerset, Oakwood to Billy
J. Konkle, 25, Somerset,
fabrication. 1/9/09.

Your Pioneer Country Music Station
Serving Rockcastle Co. Since 1957

Traditional Country • Gospel
Classic Rock & Roll

To better serve our customers, WRVK’s busines
office has relocated to 35 Lovell Ln.,

inside Saylor’s Furniture Store.
Our new office hours are 10 a.m. to 5 p.m. Monday thru Friday

Closed for lunch 12:30 p.m. to 1 p.m.
Phone - 256-2146 • Fax - 256-9146
email - manager@wrvk1460.com

DJ’s
Pete Stamper • Kevin Roberts • Charlie Napier • Wayne Combs

Donovan Howard • Jeanine Lawrence • DJ & Request Line - 256-1460
WRVK Manager - Jeanine Lawrence

WRVK 1460 AM

Subscribe
to the Signal
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Agricultural Foreign
Investment Disclosure Act

(AFIDA)
U.S. Department of Agri-

culture (USDA) regulations
specify that when a foreign
person acquires or transfers
an interest in U.S. agricultural
land, such transactions shall
be disclosed to the Secretary
of Agriculture on AFIDA Re-
port form ASCS-153 or FSA-
153. The report must be filed
with the County Farm Service
Agency (FSA) Office within
90 calendar days of the date
of the transaction.

To assist you in determin-
ing whether your land is con-
sidered agricultural land, ag-
ricultural land is: All crops,
ranch, and timberland more
than 10 acres in size in the ag-
gregate and forestland. For-
estland is land that exceeds 10
acres in size and is at least 10
percent stocked by forest
trees of any size, including
land that formerly had such
tree cover and will be natu-
rally or artificially regener-
ated.

Ownership of tracts total-
ing 10 acres or less in the ag-
gregate must produce annual
gross receipts in excess
$1,000 for the sale of the
farm, ranch, forestry or tim-
ber products to be reported.

Failure to return the com-
pleted AFIDA Report within
90 calendar days of the date
of the transaction could result
in a civil penalty of up to 25
percent of the fair market
value of the interest held in
the agricultural land. The
AFIDA Report shall be con-
sidered to have been filed in
a timely manner     if it is re-
ceived at this office within 90
calendar days of the date of
the transaction.

2009 Direct and Counter
Cyclical Program (DCP)
Secretary of Agriculture

Ed Schafer today said that en-
rollment for the 2009 Direct
and Counter-cyclical Pay-
ment (DCP) Program for
farms with base acres will
begin Dec. 22 both online and
at local USDA service centers
and will continue until June
1, 2009.

Producers are urged to
make use of the eDCP auto-
mated website to sign up;
however, producers can visit
any USDA Service Center or

their administratively as-
signed center to complete
their 2009 DCP contract.

The June 1, 2009 deadline
is mandatory for all partici-
pants. USDA will not accept
any late-filed applications.

Producers who are eligible
for the DCP Program will also
be eligible to enroll in the Av-
erage Crop Revenue Election
(ACRE) Program. The enroll-
ment period for the ACRE
Program will begin in the
spring. Producers may first
enroll in the DCP Program,
elect to receive advance direct
payments and then later
modify their enrollment to
include the ACRE program or
they may wait and elect to
enroll in DCP and ACRE at
the same time in Spring 2009.

Bank account changes
If your bank account num-

ber changes or there is a
change in your banks name

notify FSA immediately to
ensure payments reach your
account timely.

    This is very important to
those receiving FSA pay-
ments as payments can be de-
layed

if we are not aware of
changes to your account or
routing numbers.

Spousal authority
A husband and wife may

sign FSA and CCC docu-
ments on behalf of each other
UNLESS written notification
is on file in the FSA office
denying a spouse this author-
ity.

Rural Development
    The Rural Development

Representative with concern
to low income housing loans
will be in Rockcastle County
at the Rockcastle FSA office
the fourth Tuesday of each
month from 9:00 a.m. to
11:30 a.m.

Office closure
FSA offices will be closed

for the following National
Holidays:

Feb. 16th-Washington’s
Birthday

Important program dates
DCP signup continues
MILC signup continues
Conservation Reserve Pro-

gram Continuous signup con-
tinues

Quality Crop Disaster
signup continues

 Farm Ownership Loans,
Farm Operating Loans, Lim-
ited Resource Loans

Farm Storage Facility
Loan- January 2009 interest
rate- 2.125%

Tobacco Transition Pay-
ment Program-January 2009-
5.0% (Maximum Discount
Rate)

Agricultural News
By: Warden Alexander, FSA Director

Representing Rockcastle in the EKU Honors Band were from left: Michael Browning,
Ethan Miller, Andrea Gonzalez, Jarrett Hamm, Regina Rice, Matt Fields, Morgan Harper,
Dalton Hutton, Nicole McFerron, and Devin Davidson.

Ten take part in EKU Honors Band
Submitted by A. B. Sharpe
Despite school being

called off and regardless of
arctic air and snow and ice,
ten RCHS Band members
travelled to the EKU campus
in Richmond last week, Janu-
ary 15-17. Michael Brown-
ing, Devin Davidson, Matt
Fields, Andrea Gonzalez,
Jarrett Hamm, Morgan
Harper, Dalton Hutton,
Nicole McFerron, Ethan
Miller, and Regina Rice rep-
resented Rockcastle in the
EKU Honors Band. After au-
ditions and rehearsals an out-
standing concert was given in
Brock Auditorium. There
were three bands playing a
wide variety of music, with
compositions by Percy
Grainger highlighted in each.
Two of the bands directors for
this program came from the
University of North Carolina,
Chapel Hill, Bob Buckner,
Band Director for UNC, and
Doug Van Fleet, retired Band
Director from UNC. Chuck
Smith, Director of Bands for
Lafayette High School in
Lexington, directed the third
band that performed Saturday
evening. “It went really well.
Everyone really liked their di-
rectors. We all had fun over
the weekend.” Congratula-
tions to all!  Our students were
outstanding!  And special
congratulations to first chair
player Andrea Gonzalez who
was featured in a flute duet
during the concert! She per-
formed “A Tribute to
Grainger” flawlessly. Bravo!

This week, January 22-24,
five selected RCHS Band
members will travel to WKU
in Bowling Green for inclu-
sion in the WKU Honors
Band. This prestigious honors
band is for upper classmen.
Michael Browning, Anjelica
Craig, Morgan Harper,
Meghan Nation and Regina
Rice will audition for chair
placement this evening. They
will then participate in the
WKU Honors Band Clinic for
the next two days. All the hard
work in rehearsals and new
techniques learned will be
presented in a special concert
Saturday night.

Friday evening the RCHS
Pep Band will be cheering the
RCHS Basketball teams. The
Lady Rockets and the Boys
Basketball teams are playing
Casey County at home in a
doubleheader. Go Rockets!

Annual Theme Party and
Auction April 17th at 6 p.m.

at RCHS
The RCHS Band Boosters

are looking forward to spon-

soring the annual Theme
Party and Auction on April
17th. The annual event featur-
ing a catered dinner, musical
entertainment and an auction,
is a primary source of
fundraising that will be used
to send the student's to march-
ing band camp this summer.
This year, coordinator, Sherry
Harper, is opening up table
sponsorship to the public.
Local businesses or individu-
als may opt to sponsor a table
this year instead of just
booster parents. Business
owners can choose to deco-
rate their table in any fashion
they choose from “business-
related themes” to any other
party theme.  This is a great
opportunity for businesses to
get out into the community
and get to know a valued cus-
tomer base and to show off
their products or services.
There will still be opportunity
for individuals to host a table,
again of any theme of their
choosing.  Past years’ themes
have included snowmen,
Christmas, Easter, a wedding,
Hershey’s Candy, and John
Deere, just to name a few.
Anyone interested in sponsor-
ing a table or an auction item
should contact Sherry Harper
at 758-9963 as soon as pos-
sible to reserve a table.   Do-
nation of auction items is ap-
preciated from anyone and
table sponsorship is not re-
quired to donate items.

Muscle Cars on Main April
18th at RCMS

New this year, the
Rockcastle County High
School Band Boosters are
planning a Car Show on April
18th hosted by none other
than our own “Country”
Charlie Napier.  There will be
trophies, food and fun for all.
To register your vehicle or ob-
tain information about spon-
sorship or vending, contact
Anita Nation at 606-219-
0908 or 606-256-1530; Janice
Miller at 606-308-5162; Ann
Craig at 606-308-3086;
Sherry Harper at 606-758-
9869; or Connie Taylor at
859-623-2404.

Levels of sponsorship
Corporate Sponsor-this is

the highest level of sponsor-
ship and includes high visibil-
ity of corporate logo and con-
tact information on all printed
material, newspaper ads, T-
shirts, flyers, brochures and
websites including, but not
limited to advertisement and/
or a link on
www.kentuckycarshows.com.
Corporate sponsors will be
able to as much advertising
on the show site as they want
including banners, tents, etc.

Gold Sponsor-  this level
of sponsorship requires a
minimum donation of $175.
Benefits include a high level
of visibility on ads and
printed materials associated
with the promotion of the

show.  It also includes com-
plimentary show tickets and
meal tickets in quantities
commensurate with the dona-
tion.

Silver Sponsor-  this level
of sponsorship requires a
minimum donation of $125.
Benefits include a moderate
level of visibility on ads and
printed materials associated
with the promotion of the
show. It also includes compli-
mentary show tickets and
meal tickets in quantities
commensurate with the dona-
tion.

Bronze Sponsor- this level
of sponsorship requires a
minimum donation of $75.
Benefits include some visibil-
ity on ads and printed materi-
als associated with the pro-
motion of the show. It also in-
cludes complimentary show
tickets and meal tickets in
quantities commensurate
with the donation.

Friends of Muscle Cars
and Music-  this level of spon-
sorship has no minimum do-
nation and includes honorable
mention in some advertising
venues.

Registration
Registration is easy!  Call

any booster officer (listed
above) and provide your
name, address, phone, make
and model of vehicle.  Regis-
tration fee is $15 for the first
car and $10 each for addi-
tional vehicles.

ENTRY DOORS & STORM DOORS NOW AVAILABLE

Beige • Brown • Wood Grain Windows Also Available

Subscribe to
the Signal

Call
256-2244
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Commonwealth of Kentucky
Rockcastle Circuit Court

28th Judicial Circuit • Division I
Civil Action No. 08-CI-00120

VANDERBILT MORTGAGE AND
FINANCE, INC.                                      Plaintiff

V.

PAUL ROBINSON, JR.,
DOROTHY ROBINSON,
ROCKCASTLE COUNTY, KENTUCKY
AND CITIZENS BANK                     Defendants

NOTICE OF SALE

Pursuant to a Findings of Fact, Conclusion of Law, In

Rem Default Judgment and Order of Sale entered in this
action on July 26, 2008, I will offer at public auction the
hereinafter described real property and personal prop-
erty located in Rockcastle County, Kentucky:

AT THE COURTHOUSE IN THE CITY OF MT. VERNON,

ROCKCASTLE COUNTY, KENTUCKY, ON EAST MAIN

STREET ON FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 6, 2009, BEGINNING

AT THE HOUR OF 1:00 P.M. OR THEREABOUTS, THE

FOLLOWING DESCRIBED REAL PROPERTY, TO WIT:

PARCEL A:

Beginning at a stake on the north side of the county road, corner to the
property herein conveyed and other property of David Rigsby, et ux.; thence
in a northwesterly direction, 59 feet to a cedar tree, thence in a northerly
direction, 59 feet to a point; thence in a northerly direction, 45 feet to a new
corner at the cliff, thence along the cliff in a westerly direction 136 feet o
the cave at the corner, thence in a southerly direction with line of William
Fish and John W. Riddle (now Sam Bryant) to the old county road in all 138
feet; thence with the county road 178 feet to the point of beginning.

This being the same real property Mortgagor obtained by Deed dated July
3, 1991, from Dennis Rigsby, single, being of record in Deed Book 143, Page
426, in the Office of the Clerk of the Rockcastle County Court, Mt. Vernon,
Kentucky.

PARCEL B:

Beginning at a stone on the north side of the county road near a small white
walnut; thence north up the hill to a spotted oak stump near the cliff; thence
running west to a cave near William Fish and John W. Riddle’s line (now
Sam Bryant’s line); thence with said line to a corner in same on side of road;
thence east with the county road to the beginning, containing two (2) acres,
more or less.

There is excluded from the above described and not now conveyed that
portion heretofore sold to David Rigsby, et ux., by deed dated January 16,
1986, as recorded in the aforesaid clerk’s office in Deed Book 127, page 67,
and being more particularly described as follows:

Beginning at a stake on the North side of the county road corner to the
property herein conveyed and other property of grantors, thence in a north-
westerly direction 59 feet to a cedar tree thence in a Northerly direction 59
feet to a point, thence in a Northerly direction 45 feet to a new corner at the
cliff thence along the cliff in a westerly direction 136 feet to the cave at the
corner, thence in a southerly direction with line of William Fish and John W.
Riddle (now Sam Bryant) to the old county road in all 138 feet, thence with
the county road 178 feet tothe point of beginning.

Being the same real property Mortgageors obtained by Deed dated March
30, 2004, executed by Paul Robinson, Jr. and wife, Dorothy Robinson, and
Lehoma Mason and husband, William Leon Mason, of record in Deed Book
199, Page 171, in the aforesaid clerk’s office.

The proceeds of the sale shall be applied in the

following order:

(a) To the costs of this action.
(b) Rockcastle County for unpaid local, county and

state taxes.
(c) Parcel A proceeds to the defendant/cross claimant

Citizens Bank.
(d) Parcel B proceeds first to Vanderbilt Mortgage and

Finance, Inc. and then to Citizens Bank.
(e) If any remaining balance, then to the defendants

Paul Robinson, Jr. and Dorothy Robinson.
The foregoing property shall be sold separately by

the Special Master Commissioner of the

Rockcastle Circuit Court upon the following terms

and conditions:

(a) The two parcels of real property shall be sold sepa-
rate and shall not be combined.

(b) The real property shall be sold for cash or upon a
credit of thirty (30) days with the purchaser required to
pay a minimum of twenty-five percent (25%) of the pur-
chase price in cash on the date of sale and to secure the
balance with a bond bearing interest at twelve percent
(12%) per annum.

(c) Unpaid taxes or liens of record at the time of entry
of judgment shall be paid out of the proceeds of sale.

(d) The buyer(s) shall pay the year 2008 local, county
and state property taxes and all subsequent years.

(e) The buyer(s) shall have possession of the prop-
erty upon compliance with the terms of the sale.

(f) In the event the defendant/cross claimant is the suc-
cessful bidder and the sale price does not exceed the
amount of the defendant/cross claimant’s judgment, no
deposit or bond shall be required and the property will be
conveyed to the plaintiff in due season upon payment of
the expenses of sale.

The purchaser shall take the real estate free and

clear of all liens and encumbrances except:

(1) easements, restrictions and stipulations of record;
(2) assessments for public improvements levied

against the property; and
(3) any facts which an inspection and accurate survey

of the property may disclose.
The Special Master Commissioner has served notice on
the Attorney for Plaintiff and on all other parties, of the
date of sale in compliance with the court’s judgment.
This the 14th day of January, 2009.

William D. Gregory,

Special Master Commissioner

Rockcastle Circuit Court

Commonwealth of Kentucky
28th Judicial Circuit

Rockcastle Circuit Court • Division II
Civil Action No. 08-CI-00163

U.S. Bank, National Association, N.D.     Plaintiff

V.

Gustie Hurt, Jr.,
Deloris Hurt, et. al                               Defendants

NOTICE OF SALE

Pursuant to a judgment and order of sale entered in
this action on November 14, 2008 for the purpose of sat-
isfying the judgment against the defendants in the amount
of SIXTY THREE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED NINETY
DOLLARS AND 18/100 ($63,590.18) plus interest, costs
and attorney fees. I will offer at public auction the herein-
after described real property in Rockcastle County, Ken-
tucky.

At the Courthouse on East Main Street

Mt. Vernon, Kentucky

on Friday, January 23, 2009

Beginning at the Hour of 1:00 p.m.

Said real property being more particularly bounded & described
as follows:

Lot No. 42 in the Sunnyside Estates, as shown on plat of record in Plat Book 4,
page 226 in the Office of the Clerk of the Rockcastle County Court, Mt. Vernon,
Ky.

Being the same property conveyed to Gustie Hurt, Jr. et
ux. by deed dated December 20, 2002 and recorded in
Deed Book 193, page 25 in the Office of the Rockcastle
County Court Clerk.

The property shall be sold on the following terms &

conditions:

1. The real property shall be sold for cash or upon a
credit of thirty (30) days with the purchaser required to
pay a minimum of twenty-five percent (25%) of the pur-
chase price in cash on the date of sale and to secure the
balance with a bond approved by the Master Commis-
sioner.

2. The bond shall bear interest at the rate of twelve
percent (12%) per annum until paid in full. The bond shall
have the force and effect of a judgment and shall be and
remain a lien upon the property sold as additional surety
for the payment of the purchase price.

3. Unpaid taxes of record at the time of entry of judg-
ment shall be paid out of the proceeds of the sale.

4. The purchaser shall pay the 2008 local, county and
state property taxes.

5. Full satisfaction of the plaintiff’s judgment shall be
paid out of the proceeds of the sale.

6. The purchaser shall have possession of the real prop-
erty upon compliance with the terms of the sale.

7. In the event that the plaintiff is the successful bidder
and the sale price does not exceed the amount of the
plaintiff’s judgment, no deposit or bond shall be required.

8. The sale shall be made subject to all easements,
set back lines, restrictions or covenants of record or oth-
erwise and shall be sold “as is”.

Willis G. Coffey

Master Commissioner

Rockcastle Circuit Court

30x40 Commercial Building

For Lease or Rent
$450 month Plus Utilities

High traffic area on 461, 1 mile from Mt. Vernon

606-256-5678

Rockcastle Health & Rehabilitation Center would
like to honor the activity professionals throughout
the Signature HealthCARE community during Na-
tional Activity Professional Week, January 18,
through January 23, 2009.  Sharon Cunagin, Activi-
ties Director at Rockcastle Health & Rehabilitation
Center, and activities team is dedicated to enrich the
daily lives of residents at the facility.  Activity profes-
sionals provide a variety of programming related to
community involvement, mental stimulation, commu-
nity service, physical well being and all types of ac-
tivities to maintain normal life pursuits for the eld-
erly. Pictured above are, from left: Sharon Cunagin,
Pat Graves, Robin Stroh (front) and Kathy Wright.

Dear Journal,
In the past few weeks, I’ve

had correspondence in cards
and letters from family and
friends I haven’t heard of for
a long time. I’m always glad
to hear from these people, but
I’ll have to say that it’s a
shame it’s so infrequent.
People today don’t keep in
touch like they did a genera-
tion or so ago. I know, be-
cause I’m to blame for not
keeping in touch like I know
I should. If people write at all
anymore, it’s usually in the
form of an email or a text
message. The art of old-fash-
ioned letter writing is all but
gone.

One of the old-fashioned
handwritten letters that I re-
ceived recently was from a
cousin by marriage who I got
reacquainted with a few years
ago when she was doing some
family history and research in
this area. I really treasure let-
ters like these, and this one in
particular stands out. As I
read it, it sounded almost un-
believable. I’ve always heard
that “truth is stranger than fic-
tion” so this certainly must be
the case.

In short, the letter con-
veyed a love story that took
many paths through several
decades to come to fruition.
It is about a lady that had been
widowed after a long and
happy marriage to a very
wonderful man. They did ev-
erything together, and had a
very close relationship, and a
wonderful family. You could
tell from her earlier letters
that she was lost without him.
I believe her story and the
various paths that it has taken
were certainly divinely in-
spired, and I would at this
time, like to share it with you.

(The names have been
omitted for personal reasons.)
Dear Tonya,

The holidays came and
went, and it seemed like I
didn’t get letters off like I
should have. It’s always good
to hear from you, at Christ-
mas, or at any time. The past
year was very different for
me. Possibly you’ve heard
from Junior and Bernice that
my life changed.

In 1953, my dad’s job
transferred him, so my folks
had me go live with my older
unmarried sister for that
school year. During that year,
my ninth grade, I went with a
very tall, good-looking, nice
fellow. I never knew too
much about him because he
didn’t go to school all of the
time. He was a baby, and left
in the woods for somebody to
take. A childless couple found
him and raised him. Although
after about five years, they
started having children of
their own. Then, he became
just a source of income for the
family. This was why I never
saw him for part of the school
year. He worked six weeks,
then went to school for six
weeks, and made up what he
had missed. He’s always been
a worker, like my husband
was. He spent twenty-two-
plus years in the Air Force,
retiring in 1975. He had gone
to college by then, and has a
Masters in Civil Engineering
and Accounting. He is four-
teen months older than my-
self, now 71.

He took me to a few school
dances, and then to the grade
school graduation, after
which he gave me his ring.
When the school year was
over, I had to return to my
folks’ home in northern
Idaho. When my mom saw
the ring, she made me send it
back to my boyfriend. I also
wrote a letter explaining at the
time, but I never heard from
him again. I tried a couple of

times to reach him, but never
heard anymore. At the same
time, he was writing me, but
it seemed his mom and mine
were intercepting our mail, so
he and I married others and
life went on. He joined the Air
Force and fought three sieges
in Vietnam. He married a girl
I had run around with, and
had five kids. She died Janu-
ary the twenty-first, five years
ago.

Meanwhile, I married my
husband and lost him after
fifty-two years on January
twenty-first, two years ago.
Then last year, a mutual
friend came to see me here in
Arizona. For all our married
lives, we had kept in contact.
Suddenly, she went to Alaska,
and three days later married
my old boyfriend from the
ninth grade. It seems she had
known where he was all the
time, though she had never
mentioned it to me. Although
she had never had any inter-
est in him over all these years,
she knew he was much better
off than she, and though her
husband had only been gone
for six months, decided she’d
remarry. Well, it wasn’t long
before he found out she was
only after him for what she
could get. By the time they
came by here to see me, he
had decided that the marriage
was a mistake, but I didn’t
know that, and nobody told
me. When they got here in the
wee hours of January twenty-
first, we recognized each
other at once after all these
years. He had not even known
who they were coming to see.
He hugged me, and said,
“You feel as good as you did
at fifteen.”

Well, their marriage had
already gone to pot, and soon
after they returned to Alaska,
she informed him he could
sell off all of his things, and
they could move to her home-
town. Guess you’ve figured,
that didn’t happen. I didn’t
know about any of that, and
called her, only to find she
had left him. Sometime after
that, he called me to find out
what she was up to. She
hadn’t even contacted him
after leaving. They divorced,
and he came to Idaho to see
me in the spring. I spent
sometime at his place during
the summer. We got along re-
ally well, and enjoyed life
again. By the autumn, I knew
that I didn’t want to live with-
out him. He asked me to
marry him in May, but I
wanted to be sure we were
compatible on both our turfs.
We were married September
the eighth in Wasilla, Alaska.

We plan to spend our win-
ter months here in Arizona,
the spring and fall months in
my home in Idaho, and the
nice summers in Alaska. Nei-
ther of us had ever thought of
marrying again when we lost
our spouses, but as it has
turned out, we are very happy.
This doesn’t mean we can
ever “un-love” our precious
ones, but a person cannot
bring back yesterday. It was
not until he came to see me
in the spring that we ever
knew our mothers had con-
trived against us, and oh yes,
he brought “the ring” back to
me. He had kept it all those
fifty-five years. Now we
laugh and tell people that
we’ve been married a hun-
dred years; him the forty-
eight, and me the fifty-two.
Between us, we have eleven
kids, twenty grandchildren,
thirty-three great-grands, and
three more on the way.

I’m still very interested in
our genealogy, and my new
husband and I have done
some traveling and found
some more. His side was very
difficult because of his child-
hood. The last thing I found
in my genealogy was hysteri-
cal. It was in the 970s that
Lady Godiva was noted for
her nude ride through town,
rebelling against her
husband’s high rent to folks.
She was my thirty-fifth great-
grandmother. On that note, I
suppose I can leave you with
a smile on your face.

T.J.’s
Journal
by: Tonya J. Cook

Our Email has changed - now
mvsignal@windstream.net



Little over 1/2 acre, KU elec-
tric. Price reduced. 256-8708.
9x1p
For Sale: 2,397 sq. ft. 3BR/
2BA home w/CHA, storm cel-
lar, lg. barn and a 38x72 metal
garage w/electric. All furniture
in home is nego. All on 5.23
acres in Lincoln County.
$149,900. 606-758-8681.
1xntf
For Sale: (1) Lot - 6 acres
wooded on Breezy Hollow
Lane, $23,500. (2) 7.7 acres
cleared on Breezy Hollow
Lane, $29,900. (3) Two lots on
Breezy Hollow, 1.4 acres, to be
sold together, $8,500. 256-
3213 or 308-2953. 16xntf
Lots For Sale: Castle Ridge
Subdivision. Use same entry
way as Bible Baptist Church.
All lots have city sewer and
underground utilities. starting
at $12,900. 606-256-5692 •
256-4504 • 308-3730. 20xntf
For Sale: Mobile home lots,
located in Sunnyside Mobile
Home Park. 1.2 acre lots - $500
down and $100 per month. Call
606-256-5692 or 606-256-
5648. 43xntf
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CLASSIFIED RATES
• Local Rates - $4 for 25 words or

less - .10 each additional word

• Display Classifieds
$5.00/Inch

Deadline for Classifieds
is 10 a.m. TUESDAY
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For Rent

For Rent
Maple St. Storage

of Brodhead

256-2884 or
606-308-2491
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Mobile Homes
For Sale
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4115 SCAFFOLD CANE RD. - 4 bedroom, 2.5 bath, 2 story on 2 acres.
279,000. MLS31676
49 TERESA LANE - Nice singlewide in great setting. Two full acres. $47,900.
MLS32410
2916 WILDERNESS RD - Custom 2 story, 4 bedrooms, 3.5 baths. Huge
deck, above ground pool. $230,000. MLS32342
270 ROSE HILL - 3 bedroom, 3 baths, full living quarters in basement.
$149,000. MLS32283
6732 S. BRINDLE RIDGE - Custom made 4 bedroom on permanent foun-
dation. 6 stall barn. $139,900. MLS31819.
MULLINS STATION RD - Nice lot for a small home or mobile home. $7,500.
MLS32173
8999 MAIN STREET - The Livingston Market in operation for over 85 years.
$59,000. MLS32174
MAIN STREET, LIVINGSTON - Nice city lot 65x103. Mobile home al-
lowed. $10,000. MLS32175
7604 BRINDLE RIDGE RD - 3 bedroom, 2 bath brick ranch on 10 acres.
$129,900. MLS31817
4241 SCAFFOLD CANE RD - 4 bedrooms, 2.5 baths, full finished basement,
$185,000. MLS30086
8 C. VALLEY DRIVE - 10+ acres. Has several home sites. Doublewides wel-
come. $95,000
EXIT 62 RENFRO VALLEY - 20 acres overlooking I-75. $275,000. MLS25741
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY  Exit 62, Renfro Valley 1 acre leased. $150,000.
MLS25739.
RENFRO VALLEY COMMERCIAL PROPERTY. Over 2,400 sq. ft. of re-
tail space. $175,000. MLS 25740.
BEREA. We have many nice homes listed in Berea. Call one of the above agents
for a showing.

Phil Malicote, GRI-- 582-8882; Al White-- 986-2558; Janet Bowman--302-3123;
Brad Warford--582-7757; Leonard Wilder--986-3306

Dorothy Brown--200-6631; Tammy Jackson--314-3176; Steve Clark--625-4370

711 Chestnut St. • Berea • 859-986-8401
1-800-998-2063 fax 986-6173
 Office Hours: Mon. - Fri. 9 to 5; Sat. 9 to 1; Sun. by appt.

Sale Pending

Sale Pending

GILLIAM
REAL ESTATE & AUCTION

427 Chestnut Street, Berea, KY • 859-986-9797
John Gilliam • Principal Broker

Realtor Loretta Powell - 859-302-8411
www.gilliamrealestate.com

2750 Burnt Ridge Rd., Mt. Vernon  - $150,000

133 Little Clear Creek (1.675A)  - $60,000

195 Little Clear Creek (2.5+/-A) - $65,000

45 Mercury Dr., Mt. Vernon - $129,900

Deep Vista Rd., Mt. Vernon (19.17 A) - $85,000

SOLD! 215 Pine Hill Circle, Mt. Vernon - $12,000

SOLD! 17 Big Sinks Rd., Brodhead - $95,000.

3.03 A on Menifee Hill Rd. - $24,900

2.5 A on Menifee Hill Rd. - $18,900

SOLD! Lot #4 - East Fork Rd. 2.57 A - $18,200

Lot #7 - Hwy. 1249, 3.7 A. - $25,000

For Rent: 2 BR house, oil heat.
In Livingston. 453-3481. 7x3p
For Rent: 2 BR, 2 BA trailer
in Brodhead. No pets. Must
have references. 758-8700.
For Rent: House, 2 miles from
Mt. Vernon. No pets. Deposit
and references necessary. Call
256-4252.
For Rent: Nice two bedroom
mobile home. $375 month plus
deposit. 606-758-4985. 8x2p
House For Rent: 3 BR home
in Brindle Ridge area
(Roundstone School). Stove
and refrigerator furnished.
$550 month plus deposit. No
pets. 859-925-3080. 8x2p
For Lease or Rent: 30x40
commercial building, 1 mile
from Mt. Vernon on 461. High
traffic area. $450 month plus
utilities. Call 606-256-5678.
8x4p
Barnett Storage and Rental.
5x10, $25 monthly; 10x10, $35
monthly. 1 mile from Mt.
Vernon. Call or see Ronnie at
Barnett Cycle. 606-256-5678.
8x4p
For Rent: 2 BR mobile home,
stove and refrigerator fur-
nished. Quarry St., Mt. Vernon.
No pets. $300 month/$300 de-
posit. 606-308-4592. 7xntf
For Rent: 2 bedroom house
with big yard on 490. $300
month/$400 deposit. Call 606-
392-9633. 7x3p
For Rent: Duplex in
Brodhead. All appliances fur-
nished. Call Patty 758-9666.
5xntf
For Rent: 2 and 3 bedroom
trailer, starting as low as $200
month plus $200 deposit. Call
256-9889 or 606-308-5389.
7x4
For Rent: 2 bedroom trailer in
Mt. Vernon. 859-358-3560 or

256-9943. 47xntf
For Rent: Small 2 bedroom
trailer in Mt. Vernon.  No pets.
Also, house in Brodhead. 758-
4729. 40xntf
For Rent: Accepting applica-
tions at Mt. Vernon Housing
Authority on Mondays 9 a.m.
til 12 noon. Rent based on in-
come. 256-4185. 14xntf
Accepting Applications: For
2 and 3 bedroom units at Val-
ley View Apartments. Rent
based on income. Call 256-
5912. Equal Housing Opportu-
nity, TDD for hearing impaired
only. 1-800-247-2510. 36tfn

For Sale By Land Contract:
Rustic Alpine style house.
3633 square feet with 4 acres
of mostly woodland located at
211 Swiss Hills, 3/10 mile
from the city limits of Bera.
Will consider trade. 606-256-
9053. 7x3p
For Sale: Nice home on one
plus acres between Daytona
Beach and Cape Kennedy.
Close to river and beach.
Fenced in, beautiful trees - in-
cluding several fruit trees. 386-
345-0420. 9x3p
Land For Sale By Owner: At
Rainbow Ridge Subdivision.

Posted: No trespassing on
property of Darrell and Helen
Whitaker, located on East Fork
of Skaggs Creek and Cut Gap.
Keep out!! 32(08)x51p
Posted: No trespassing, ATVs
on land belonging to Billy
Whitaker on Skaggs Creek.
Posted: Property Rev. Frank
Chrisman leases behind Phila-
delphia Baptist Church. No
trespassing, 4 wheeling, hunt-
ing. 9x1p
Posted: No hunting/trespass-
ing on property belonging to
Farmer Waddle and Clista
Spivey heirs n Hwy 490. Vio-
lators will be prosecuted. Not
responsible for accidents. 6x6p
Posted: No trespassing or
hunting on land of J.B. Baker,
located at Climax. 8x3p
Posted: No hunting, trapping
or trespassing on property be-
longing to William Holt,
Winkie Holt or Neureul Jones,
located in Kidwell Hollow.
Violators will be prosecuted.
7x5p
Posted: No hunting or tres-
passing on Ed Wilson Farm,
5320 Hummel Road, Wildie.
44(08)x52p
Posted: No hunting/trespass-
ing on property belonging to
Farmer Waddle and Clista
Spivey heirs on Hwy. 490. Vio-
lators will be prosecuted. Not
responsible for accidents.
42(08)x25p
Posted: No trespassing on
Crawford Place - Old
Brodhead Road. Danny Smith.
47tfn
Posted: Absolutely no hunting,
fishing or trespassing on prop-
erty belonging to Mark and
Debbie Cummins. Violators
will be prosecuted. 9x52p
Posted: No hunting, trespass-
ing or ATVs on land belong-
ing to Victoria Reese at
Roundstone. Not responsible
for accidents.
Posted: No trespassing on
property known as C.B. Owens
Farm across from Fairgrounds
in Brodhead. Violators will be
prosecuted. 25tfn

Posted: No hunting or tres-
passing on property owned by
Doug and Judy Brock known
as Brock’s North Hill Farm at
Maretburg consisting of the
Swinney Place, Brock Place,
Hensley Farm, Lakes Farm. 3tf

For Sale: Used doublewide.
1500 sq. ft., needs repair. Best
offer. 859-582-5808. 9x4p
For Sale: 14x70 Norris mobile
home with slide out addition.
Remodeled. Serious inquiries
only. 606-308-2885. 8x2p
For Sale: Trailer and lot in
Livingston. 453-3481. 7x3p
(AAA) Looking For A Home?
Do you own land or have fam-
ily land? Zero down easy fi-
nancing for 1st time home buy-
ers! Govt. funds available for
limited credit. Call 606-365-
9119 to get prequalified! 51x12
For Sale: 2006 Giles
doublewide mobile home, 3
bedrooms, 2 baths, front and
rear deck, guttering and under-
pinning. Must be moved. All
appliances including washer
and dryer stay. Serious inquir-
ies only. 758-4735 or 758-
8994. 7tfn
Used Homes For Sale: Nice 2
BR. Take over payments. 606-
524-4278. 8x1
Norris D/Wide With Land
Take over payments. Ready to
move in. 606-344-3347 or 878-
7055. 9x1
(AAA) Socia security/SSI:
$1300 net month. We can put
you in a new home. 606-524-
0286. 9x1
Government Funds Avail-
able: Easy qualifying, easy fi-
nancing. Manufactured homes
606-309-3347 after 10 a.m.
9x1
Nice Country Living: 4 Bed-
rooms, 2 baths. Owner will fi-
nance. 606-524-0286  9x1
Got Land - Get A home: Your
land is your down payment.
606-524-4278. 9x1
Luv Homes of Somerset has
government first time home
buyer loans. 3BRs for $287.33
monthly/240 months/$35,000
amount financed/7.756 annual
percentage rate/$1,750 down
payment. 606-676-0503. 8x1
Used Homes For Immediate
Sale: 16 wide, 3BRs. $14,500/
$16,500/$18,500. 606-676-
0503. 8x1
LUV Homes of Somerset will
have you in a new 5 BR home
for only $499 monthly, set up
on your land. Amt. financed
$87,000/5.99 annual percent-
age rate/360 month term. 606-
676-0503. 9x1
Can’t Get a Home Loan? If
you have a deed or $5,000
cash, LUV Homes of Somerset
may be able to  help even if
your credit’s not what it was.
Call now for pre-approval.
606-676-0503. 9x1
1991 Northern built by
Redman. 24x44 double wide.
Delivered and set up with new
carpet and central air. $22,900.
D&D Mobile Homes, 2 miles
north of Stanford on Hwy. 27.
Ph. 606-365-9165. 8x4
Zero Down Payment with
deed to property or relative’s
property, or as little as 5% cash
down with no land. Easy fi-
nancing available. We own the

bank!! Phone applications ac-
cepted. 606-451-0715. wac
8x4
FHA Loans, SSI or Disabil-
ity Income Loans, First Time

Homebuyer Loans. Land/
Home packages. We have the
loan you need. Call now to get
prequalified. 606-451-0748.
8x4

Commonwealth of Kentucky
28th Judicial Circuit

Rockcastle Circuit Court • Division I
Civil Action No. 08-CI-00232

Community Trust Bank, Inc. Plaintiff
V.

Leslie Jadawn Pennington,
et al Defendants

NOTICE OF SALE

Pursuant to a judgment and order of sale entered in
this action on December 5, 2008, for the purpose of sat-
isfying the judgment against the defendants in the amount
of EIGHT THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED TWENTY-
THREE DOLLARS AND 14/100 ($8,323.14) plus inter-
est and costs. I will offer at public auction the hereinafter
described real property in Rockcastle County, Kentucky.

At the Courthouse on East Main Street

Mt. Vernon, Kentucky

on Friday, January 23, 2008

Beginning at the hour of 1:00 p.m.

Said property being more particularly bounded and
described as follows:

Being Lot Number One Hundred Sixty Three (163) in the Rainbow Ridge Subdivi-
sion (Phase #2) and fronting on Gold Dust Drive.  For further description see plat
recorded in the Office of the Clerk of the Rockcastle County Court in Plat Book 4,
page 353 (Slide 578).  Tax Map Reference 033-80-00-163

Being the same property Jeffrey Pennington and L.
Jadawn Pennington obtained by deed dated March 31,
2006 of record in Deed Book 209, page 663 and of record
at the Rockcastle County Court Clerk’s office, Mt. Vernon,
Kentucky.

The property shall be sold upon the following

terms and conditions:

1. The real property shall be sold for cash or upon a
credit of thirty (30) days with the purchaser required to
pay a minimum of twenty-five percent (25%) of the pur-
chase price in cash on the date of sale and to secure the
balance with a bond approved by the Master Commis-
sioner.

2. The bond shall bear interest at the rate of twelve
percent (12%) per annum until paid in full. The bond shall
have a force and effect of a judgment and shall be and
remain a lien upon the property sold as additional surety
for the payment of the purchase price.

3. Unpaid taxes of record at the time of entry of judg-
ment shall be paid out of the proceeds of the sale.

4. The purchaser shall pay the 2009 local, county and
state property taxes.

5. Full satisfaction of the plaintiff’s judgment shall be
paid out of the proceeds of sale.

6. The purchaser shall have possession of the real
property upon compliance with the terms of the sale.

7. In the event that the plaintiff is the successful bid-
der and the sale price does not exceed the amount of the
plaintiff’s judgment, no deposit or bond shall be required.

8. The sale shall be made subject to all easements,
set back line, restrictions or covenants or record or oth-
erwise and shall be sold “as is”.

Jerome S. Fish,

Special Master Commissioner

Due to the installation of a new water line,
Brodhead Water System has called a

BOIL WATER ADVISORY
until further notice for the following areas:

Hwy. 1505 beginning at the junction of Hwy. 150
to the end of Hwy. 1505 and all streets or roads

that junction with Hwy. 1505

This Boil Water Advisory will not be lifted until
the water line and tank are completed.

Attention
BRODHEAD

WATER CUSTOMERS

Come see Gary Gentry
for the best selection in

pre-owned vehicles!!
You have a friend in the car business!

606-678-8178

Subscribe to the Signal
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Professional
Services
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Wanted - Notice
Paying fair price for
junked or wrecked ve-
hicles.

Call day or night
606-453-2027 or

606-308-9500

STEWART SALVAGE
We buy junked or

repairable vehicles.
Also, used parts for sale.

Call 859-358-3560 or
606-256-9943 anytime

Will babysit, day or night, any shift.
Will also babysit on weekends, any

shift. Very reliable references.

For more info
606-308-5500

Classified Order Form
________________________________________
________________________________________
________________________________________
________________________________________
________________________________________
________________________________________
________________________________________
________________________________________
________________________________________
Costs: $4.00 per week for 25 words or less. Please add 10¢ more for each word
over 25.

Payment enclosed       Check        Money Order
    VISA        Mastercard
Acct #

Exp. Date

Please mail to Mount Vernon Signal
PO Box 185 • Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456

Or have Credit Card # ready and phone 606-256-2244 to place your ad
Ad must be received by 10 a.m. Tuesday

CLASSIFIED ADS
NOTICE

All classified advertisements must
now be paid for in advance.

For your convenience, we now  accept VISA and Mastercard
To place your classified, have your credit card ready and call 606-256-2244 or simply fill out the form

below and mail your ad along with your check  or credit card information

Absolutely no classifieds can be
placed over the phone without

paying at time of placing
advertisement

Men’s & Women’s
Alterations
Martha’s Sewing

Mending, Dressmaking,
Alterations

(606) 453-4483
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Miscellaneous
For Sale
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Notices

Epperson Air Conditioning,
Heating, Plumbing,

Electric

wishes to acquire similar
operating businesses and assets.

Call 606-679-7476.
Located at

112 W. University Drive
Somerset, Ky. 42503
EOE & Drug Free Workplace

Communications Specialist
and

Training Specialist
Berea College is currently recruiting for two new, full time
positions for the GEAR UP (Gaining Early Awareness and
Readiness for Undergraduate Programs) program located at
Berea College.  GEAR UP is a federally funded outreach pro-

gram serving students and
schools in Estill, Jackson,
Lee, Madison, and
Rockcastle counties.

Communications Special-
ist: Reporting to the Direc-
tor, the Communications
Specialist will be respon-
sible for the following: de-
veloping written communi-
cations for over 4,000
GEAR UP parents, includ-

ing monthly reports, brochures and college access informa-
tion; maintaining the GEAR UP website and social network-
ing sites; writing articles on college access and success for
various publications; maintaining the GEAR UP database; fa-
cilitating communications between GEAR UP and our part-
ners, including parents, teachers, principals, businesses and
community based organizations; ensuring that all communi-
cations are consistent in support of the goals and objectives of
GEAR UP; and evaluating the effectiveness of GEAR UP com-
munications. A Bachelor’s Degree in English, Journalism, com-
munications or a related field is required for consideration.
Two+ years experience in marketing or communications is also
required. A detailed position description is available upon re-
quest.

Training Specialist: Reporting to the Director, the Training
Specialist will develop and coordinate GEAR UP professional
development programs for educators, families, students and
partners in the five county region of Madison, Estill,
Rockcastle, Jackson and Lee Counties. The Training Special-
ist will provide effective college access and success programs
for all GEAR UP constituents and will evaluate the college
planning needs for these groups.  Additionally, this position
will ensure that all programs support the GEAR UP goals and
objectives. A Bachelor’s Degree in education or a related field
is required for consideration; a minimum of 5 years experi-
ence working with Kentucky schools or colleges as an educa-
tor, counselor or resource person is also required. A detailed
position description is available upon request.

To Apply For Either of the Above Positions:
An Application to Join the College Staff is required and is avail-
able in the Office of People Services, Suite 100, Fairchild Hall
on the campus or may be obtained by calling (859) 985-3070
or 985-3050 or online at www.berea.edu/hr. Completed appli-
cations may be mailed to People Services, CPO 2189, Berea,
KY 40404 or faxed to (859) 985-3911.

Berea College, in light of its mmission in the tradition of im-
partial love and social equality, welcomes all people of the
earth to learn and work here. Employment decisions are based
on training, education and experience related to the require-
ments of the job. All applicants for employment are consid-
ered without regard to race, color, religion, gender, sexual
orientation, national origin, age or disability.

Drivers: Dedicated Runs! Top
consistent freight, miles, top
pay and home-time @ Werner
Enterprises. 800-346-2818
x150. 7x7p
Days Inn in Mt. Vernon is
taking applications for front
desk position. Must be flexible
to work all shifts. Must be at
least 18 years old and have ba-
sic computer/typing skills. Ap-
plications can be picked up at
the front desk. 9x1
Epperson Air Conditioning •
Heating • Plumbing • Electric
is seeking HVAC mechanics
and plumbers. Call 606-679-
7476, 112 W. University Dr.,
Somerset, Ky. 42503. EOE and
Drug free work place. 24xntf
AVON: Earn money by selling
Avon. 1-888-528-7875. 49xntf

For Sale: Square bales of hay
- orchard grass mix. 758-8190
or 606-392-1396. 8x4p
For Sale: Seasoned firewood.
606-453-2027. 5x6p
For Sale: Organic all-natural
eggs. Med - $1 dozen, large/
XLg. $1.50 dozen. 606-256-
8780. 9x4p
For Sale: Dining room hutch
with mirrors and five foot
wide. $150. 758-8427.
For Sale: 12x20 metal storage
building. New $2,500 - Sale
$1,700. 453-3648. 7x4p
For Sale: Cemetery lots,
Cresthaven Cemetery, Mt.
Vernon. Call Bill Dowell at
308-1058. 31xntf
Carhartt stonewash denim
jeans, relax or regular fit.
$26.50. Large selection of
Carhartt rough and casual
wear. Napier Brothers Clothing
Store, 35 Public Square,
Lancaster. 859-792-2535.
18tfn

I, Colen Short, will not be re-
sponsible for  debts made by
anyone other than myself. 7x5p
Notice is hereby given that
Charlotte Bullock, 1075 Ot-
tawa School Road,
Brodhead,Ky. 40409 has been
appointed Executrix of the es-

tate of Marshall Scoggin on the
6th day of January, 2009. Any
person having claims against
said estate shall present them,
according to law, to the said
Charlotte Bullock or to
Hon.Michael Fore, Thompson,
Simons, Dunlap and Fore,
P.S.C., 116 W. Main St., Suite
2A, Richmond, Ky. 40476-
0726 on or before May 6, 2009
at 11 a.m. 8x3
Notice is hereby given that
Barbara Ann Schrink, 4766
Brindle Ridge Road,
Brodhead, Ky. 40409 has been
appointed lguardian of Corey
Vance Hacker on the 3rd dayof
November, 2008. Any person
having claims against said es-
tate shall present them, accord-
ing to law, to the said Barbara
Schrink on or before May 4th,
2009 at 11 a.m. 9x2

Gravel Hauling: Driveways,
ets. 256-4695 or mobile 859-
544-7730. 14xntf
Overbay’s Handyman Ser-
vice. All home repair and tree
cutting. 606-308-9549. 51tfn
Jonathan Collins Remodel-
ing. No job too big or too
small. Free estimates 606-256-
5459. ntf
Jim Sandusky Roofing: Free
estimates. Cell 1-859-983-
7877. 40tfn
Larry’s Seamless Guttering,
Vinyl siding, soffit and replace-
ment windows. Fully insured.
Free estimates. 606-308-1030
or 606-758-4228. 44xntf
Phelps Roofing. Owner Mike
Phelps. Insured, references
available, free estimates. 16
years experience. Ph. 606-758-
8874. 41xntf
Notice: Will haul off or buy
scrap metal, junk cars or trucks.
Metal hauled for free. 859-353-
1769. 14xntf
Grave Markers & Monu-
ments: In stock at all times.
McNew Monument Sales, US
25, 4 miles north of Mt.
Vernon. Phone 256-2232.
13xntf
U Call We Haul! Moving?
Need Help? Cars, furniture,
construction cleanup -- any-
thing that fits on a truck, large
or small! We will also haul
your junk car or truck away for
free. No Garbage!! Light back-
hoe and landscaping. 256-9222
or 606-308-1629. 27xntf

P&P Guttering: 5 & 6 inch
seamless gutters, siding, soffit
and window installation. Call
256-4393. Free estimates.
21xntf
Lovell’s Gun Sales & Repair:
New and used guns for sale.
Ammo and gun accessories.
Repairs, stock refinishing, hot
bluing. Certified gunsmith/li-
censed firearms dealer. Maple
Grove Road. Mon-Fri. 5 to 8
p.m. 256-3539. 11tfn

Gail’s Pampered Pooch
57 West Main St. • Brodhead
For appt. call 606-758-0064

17 Years Experience Pet
Grooming 20xntf
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Motor Vehicles
For Sale

For Sale: AKC registered Lab
puppies. $250 ea. Call 859-
302-3362. 3xntf

Subscribe to
the Signal!

Call
256-2244

For Sale: 2001 Kawasaki
Vulcan, 800cc engine, V-twin,
low miles, excellent condition.
$3,500. Call 606-308-5087.
9x1p
For Sale: ‘87 Lincoln Town
Car, $800. Good shape. 606-
256-0379.
For Sale: 2007 Suzuki Reno
hatchback, 4 door, AC, CD
player, power windows, excel-
lent condition, bumper to
bumper warranty. $8,800. 758-
9605 after noon. 42tfn
For Sale: 1991 Chevy Blazer,
V8, cow hood, $2,800; 1999
Ford Dually, extended cab, 7.3
diesel, 70K, $12,500; 2004
Futian Tractor, 3 cyl. diesel,

4WD, front end loader, $4,800;
2007 model 14x7x7 enclosed
trailer - like new, $3,800; 1964
Ford dump truck, only 39K,
$2,500; 49 Ford street rod,
$10,000; 1972 Chevy pick-up,
$2,000; 1989 Dodge camper
van, $3,800. Also several farm
tractors and equipment. Sev-
eral riding lawn mowers. 606-
256-4739 or 606-308-4739.
8x2p
For Sale: 1986 International
Dump Truck TD466. Diesel
engine, 7 speed transmission.
859-661-2814. 8xntf
For Sale: Ford single axel road
tractor. 300 Cummins diesel
engine, 9 speed transmission.
859-661-2814. 8xntf
For Sale: 1968 Ford F600 line
truck. 859-661-2814. 8xntf
For Sale: 1975 6040 Allis
Chalmers diesel tractor. 859-
661-2814. 8xntf
For Sale: 1963 Farmall cub
tractor w/cultivators. 859-661-
2814. 8xntf
For Sale: 1963 Ford Tractor
4000. 859-661-2814. 8xntf
For Sale: 6 ft. bushhog. 859-
661-2814. 8xntf
For Sale: Team Iron Wheel
Owensboro Wagon, excellent
condition. 859-661-2814.
8xntf
For Sale: 2002 27 ft. Toy
hauler camper. Sleeps 6 plus.
Can haul a small car or Jeep.
New tires, new gas tanks, etc.
$9,500. 2006 Soft Tail custom
STS motor, new pipes, $9,500
obo. 1999 450 Honda 4
wheeler, electric shift. $2,395
obo. 1999 350 Big Bear 4x4
Yamaha 4 wheeler, $1,495
obo. 1996 400 Kodiak 4x4
Yamaha 4 wheeler, $1,350
obo. 1986 TRX 70 Honda 4
wheeler. Great 4 wheeler for a

child. $650 obo. 2005 CRF 230
Honda dirt bike. FMF pipe, rev
box. Reduced to $2,295. 1986
S10 Chevy pickup, V8 motor,
headers, turbo trainny, $1,500.
Dodge camper V6, $700. 1995
CB 750 Night Hawk. IV line,
4 cyl., ready to go, $2,650. For
all your street dirt ATV parts
and accessories, call and ask
for Ronnie at Barnett Cycle,
606-256-5678, Hwy. 461 to-
ward Somerset. 8x4p



Virginia McKinney
Income Tax Service

606-256-4804

Electronic Filing Available

Heating & Air

COMPLETE HOME
COMFORT

Locally owned and Located at:
575 Richmond Street • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

Rodney Smith
Office: 606-256-1683 • Cell: 859-661-5986

We service all Brands and Models
20+ years experience • Free Estimates

Affordable Service - Call for Rates
Expert Installation and Troubleshooting

Friendly Hometown Service

Heat Pumps and Gas Furnaces
We also sell Gas Logs and Heaters
Fully Licensed and Insured HVAC and Electrical

MO-4808 and CE63779
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BEE Garbage
256-2334

Weekly residential
curbside pickup

$1700 per month with Curb Cart

Morgan Plumbing
Service & Repair

New Construction • Commercial & Residential Service

Fully Insured • All Work Guaranteed

256-4766 • 606-232-0666
MPL #6761

5076 S Wilderness Rd. • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

B.C.C. Metals

Help Around The
House

• Interior & Exterior Painting
• Pressure Washing

• General  Maintenance

Randy Mink
Owner/Operator

14 Willow Ave.  • Brodhead, Ky.

606-308-3238
606-758-9760

On-Site
Computer Service

Tired of
sending your

computer away
to get it fixed?

Call and let us come to you for
all your computer needs!

Setup, Consultation,
Software/Hardware

Conflicts
Virus/Spyware Removal

Reasonable Rates

Call Spencer Benge at
606-308-5653

Lester Kirby
Tree Trimming

No Job Too Big or Too Small
Fully Insured • Free Estimates

Firewood For Sale
$30 Pickup Load • Not Delivered

Home 606-256-3626 • Cell 606-308-2016

Why
Pay

More?
606-256-9870

Men’s &
Women’s

Alterations
Martha’s Sewing

Mending, Dressmaking
Alterations

(606) 453-4483

Mobley’s
Heating & Air

“We put quality first to make them last”
Owner: Aaron Mobley
1-606-224-8941 MO# 4920

Anglin
Logging

Buy standing timber
or share cut

David Anglin or
Scott Anglin

606-256-5483

24 Hour Wrecker Service
Long Distance Towing
Small & Heavy Duty
Auto & Truck Repairs

David’s Tire Center
Hwy. 150 • Mt. Vernon

All Major Brand Tires
For Cars & Trucks

Farm Tractors
Lawn & More

David & Josh Thompson, Owners
Office/24 Hr. Wrecker 606-256-4606
Mobile 606-308-4592 or
606-308-4593

David
Spoonamore

ROOFING
Free Estimates

25 Years experience
Call 758-4457 or

606-231-4118

Located on Hwy. 461 bypass behind Sabrina’s Hair Design

606-256-9619

ROCKET SPORTS

& APPAREL

MOBILE PRESSURE WASHING
Decks, concrete, aluminum and vinyl siding,

brick and stone, machinery, equipment
 and much more.
Benny Rader

606- 308-3149 or 606-256-3293
Big Discount for all Churches - Call us!

Covenant Surveying, LLC
Land surveying, topographical
mapping, construction staking.
Professionally Licensed

Surveyor
606-256-0224

U
SA

Sporting Goods,
Custom Screen Printing & Embroidering

Tuesday - Friday
10 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Saturday
 10 a.m. to 2 p.m.

equipment hauling ~ basements ~ building sites roads ~ ponds
crushed stone ~ fill dirt ~ topsoil ~ finish grading ~ clearing
general farm maintenance ~ underground utilities ~ footers
certified septic tanks ~ licensed septic system installation

10% Discount Through February!!

606-256-5370 or 859-661-2814

Carpenter’s Dozer
& Backhoe Service

Town & Country
24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE

All Types of Mechanic Work

Call 256-9634 days or
256-4650 nights

MADISON TERMITE
and PEST CONTROL

Call Paul Burton - Day or Night
256-2318 - Mt. Vernon

-----
STOP TERMITES  ROACHES  WATERBUGS

Winstead’s
Heating & Air

“We Sell the Best and Service the Rest”

Financing Available
6 Months Same As Cash/6 Months Deferred Payment

Finance Charges accrue from the date of sale unless the Same As Cash plan balance is paid in full prior to the Same As Cash expiration
date, in which case they are waived. Regular credit terms apply after the Same As Cash period expires. Annual Percentage Rate 17.90%.
Minimum Finance Charge: $2.00. (APR and Minimum Finance Charge may be lower in some states.) Terms subject to change without
notice. Subject to credit approval. See Account Agreement for complete information and important disclosures. Other open-end and

closed-end credit plans may be available. Ask seller for details. All credit plans subject to normal credit policies.

Pat Winstead
606-256-1038 • 606-308-4825

Now selling
Trane

equipment!

M04434

Featuring metal roofing, siding,
trim and insulation.

Same day service available on most orders.
Contact Jerry Blair

Toll Free 1-800-658-4902
Located 4 miles south of Berea, off U.S. 25 at 862 Lambert Rd.

Serving Rockcastle County and surrounding counties.

www.bccmfg.com

Caudill Dump Truck Service
Rock • Gravel
Agr. Lime
Sand

Rock & Job Quotes
Driveway Spreading
Dumping/Stockpile

Contact for competitive pricing:
Myron - (606) 308-1387
Randall - (606) 308-3280

Mark’s
Welding & Fabrication

U.S. 25 North, Renfro Valley

606-256-1504 • 606-308-4579
Open 8 to4 Monday thru Friday

“20 Years Experience”

Aluminum Cast Iron

Window &

Door

Security

Guards

We can helpprotect youroutdoor heatingand coolingsystems fromtheft!!

For an appointment
Call 256-3976

Electronic Filing
Available

Individuals - Partnerships - Corporations
INCOME TAX SERVICE
Karen K.King

Tell ‘em you
saw their ad

in the

PERRY’S Autobody &
Auto Rental Service

Full body, frame and paint service
60 Mill Street • Mt. Vernon

PERRY & AMY MINK PROPERTIES, LLC
Storage and Rental Units • 12x20 units fully lined floor to

ceiling & fenced for your security
Fairground Hill off Hwy. 150 • Formerly AB Thomason Property

606-256-5198 or 606-308-1008

Eads Fence Co.
Chain -Link, Vinyl & all types of wood fence

Free Estimates
Call toll free 1-800-989-8006

or 859-624-2525
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She was a most intelligent
young woman, who had come
for counseling because her hus-
band insisted. (Though she is
not a real person, I have known
people like her.)  She had re-
ceived four DUIs in the past six
years and had lost her driver’s
license for two years. She had
taken alcohol education classes
when so ordered by the court.
In spite of all this, she insisted,
“I don’t have a problem with
alcohol. I just get caught a lot.”

It may seem strange that this
woman could continue to insist
she had no problem in light of
the evidence.  However, it is not
that unusual for a person to fail
to see and acknowledge his or
her own problems. This is the
Land of  Denial in which many
addicts live.

Counselors are trained to
spot problems even in the face
of denial.  While it is not hard
to see that the woman quoted
above had a problem, often the
problem is harder to discern.
Several screening techniques
are used by therapists to dis-
cover if addiction is a problem.

One screening approach,
CAGE, consists of four ques-
tions:

1.  Have you ever felt you
should CUT down on your
drinking?

2.  Have people ANNOYED
you by criticizing your drink-
ing?

3.  Have you ever felt bad or
GUILTY about your drinking?

4.  Have you ever had a drink
first thing in the morning (an
EYE-OPENER) to steady your
nerves or get rid of a hangover?

Even one positive answer to
these questions indicates the
presence of an alcohol problem.

Another test used to screen
for alcohol problems consists of
only one question: “When was
the last time you had more than
four drinks (five for men) in one
day?”  If this has happened any-
time in the last three months, it
is assumed that this person has
an alcohol problem.

In my work as a domestic
violence counselor, I see the
damage that alcohol and other
drugs can do to a family.  While
alcohol does not cause abuse, it
can make the abuse worse.  Liv-
ing with an angry, violent abuser

is bad. Living with an angry,
violent and alcoholic or drug ad-
dicted abuser is even worse.
When he drinks, his rage may
be uncontrollable.

Being an alcoholic is no ex-
cuse for destructive behavior.
Some abusers say, “I was drink-
ing, and I don’t remember hit-
ting you,” as if this absolves
them of any guilt. It does not. If
drinking causes them to become
violent, then they should not
drink.  The choice is made when
that first drink is taken. The ad-
dict always has a choice.

That choice is not always an
easy one.  Biological evidence
now indicates that there is a ge-
netic component to alcoholism.
There is something different
about the body of this person
that makes him more likely to
become addicted than someone
else would be. For this person
the only safe way to drink is not
to drink at all. A check of the
family tree can quickly reveal
which families tend to become
addicted to alcohol.

Once there was great shame
attached to being addicted.  This
is no longer the case as many

famous people have come out
of the closet about their
struggles with addiction.  Presi-
dent George Bush acknowl-
edges that prior to the age of 40
he had an alcohol problem.
With prodding from his wife, he
quit drinking.  Former First
Lady Betty Ford has a clinic for
addiction treatment named after
her as recognition of her will-

The
Family Room

By: Dr. Roy Don Whitehead

ingness to tell her story publicly.
If the above screening tests

indicate you have a problem,
there is help.  Call a counselor,
your doctor or Alcoholics
Anonymous B now.
[If you need help or informa-
tion about domestic violence,
call Family Life Abuse Center

at 800-755-5348.]

Yards to Paradise
Woodpeckers, Anyone?
Most folks enjoy seeing

birds and other wildlife in their
neighborhood.  Had you
thought about woodpeckers?

Why would anyone want
woodpeckers, you might ask?
Don’t they just peck holes in
homes and in our landscape
timber? Let’s consider these
and related points in today’s
column.

 Bird watching and bird feed
have become very popular.
They have their own maga-
zines, they have tons of space
devoted to them at large big-
box stores.  And, woodpeckers
are among the most colorful of
birds. They are interesting crea-
tures, to be sure.

Woodpeckers can be found
most anywhere there are tim-
bers or trees.  They prefer some
older logs, snags, rotting lum-
ber, actually.  They very seldom
attack sound wood.

It is the dead wood that is
home to insects,  you know,
bugs, beetles, termites, etc.

These are the types of things
that make a major part of the
diet of woodpeckers, although
they will eat fruit, animal fat,
and sometimes seeds and other
nutritious items.

Since most people are will-
ing to share their insects with
birds, maybe you’d like to re-
consider the woodpecker.  They
have two toes forward and two
toes backward, not three and
one as most birds do, so they
can hang upside down on tree
limbs and peck into cracks with
their “ratt-a-tatt-tatt” looking
for lunch behind bark or inside
decaying wood.

 To supplement existing for-
aging and nesting habitat, con-
sider leaving an old dead tree
snag on your property. Also
consider planting some fruit
and nut trees.  The sapsucker
will appreciate apple and maple

trees, and is considered to be
in the woodpecker family of
birds.

If you want’ you can make
a birdhouse for woodpeckers.
Their preference is a big knot-
hole or a hole they peck out
themselves from a dead or
partly dead tree trunk—they are
cavity dwellers.  A lack of old
trees has become a problem for
woodpeckers, bluebirds, and
other cavity dwelling birds in
the wild.

Suet feeders are the type you
want if you plan to offer up
lunch to a woodpecker in your
yard. Store bought ones, or
home made ones, no
matter…you want to make it so
they can’t get to all the food at
once and waste it.  (An accept-
able preparation is 4 parts corn
meal, one part solid shortening,
1 part flour, and 1 part peanut
butter, well mixed and placed
in a suet feeder…even a hole
drilled in a tree and this “din-
ner preparation” stuffed inside
and tamped down will be at-
tractive to woodpeckers and
several other birds in your
backyard.)

If you have trouble with
woodpeckers pecking your
home siding, you might fill any
holes, repair any rotting wood,
and repaint.  That should help
considerably, as the woodpeck-
ers are usually just looking to
lunch upon the insects in the
wood.

To obtain further informa-
tion on woodpeckers or other
wildlife, visit the Natural Re-
source Conservation Service.
Go online to
www.nrcs.usda.gov or call 1-
888 LANDCARE for a free
colorful booklet filled with tips
and ideas.

The author is a landscaper. To give
feedback or to contact, go to

www.rockcastles.com

Don’t Want to Cook?
Don’t Want to Get Out?
Check out these specials!
Good thru Feb. 22nd - Dine-In/Carry-Out/Delivery

Lg. 1 Topping  with Lg. Cheese
Bread, 2 Liter Pepsi Products

$19.95

Two Steak Hoagies of your
choice, 2 bags chips, 2 drinks

$13.75

Lg. Pizza with everything - $17

5 Topping Beast with
medium cheese

bread,
2 liter Pepsi Product

$29.50

Beast Supreme w/small cheese
bread & 2 liter Pepsi Product

$28.00

Buy One Baked Spaghetti Dinner
- Includes 4 Garlic Sticks and

Drink for $6.75 -
Get 2nd One 1/2 Price!!

We also do birthday parties,
school gatherings, any kind of private party

Mt. Vernon Pizza and Subs
(formerly Frank’s Pizza)

Now under new ownership of Kathy Mullins
Hwy. 25S • Mt. Vernon

Ph. 606-256-5000

Potatoes  $349 
10 lb.

Vine Ripe Tomatoes • Sweet Onions
Sweet Potatoes

Sorghum  $549 
44 oz. jar

Jams • Jellies • Old Fashion Candy
New supply of antiques

(Not affiliated with Renfro Valley Entertainment Center)

Renfro Valley
Country Market

145 Hummel Road • Renfro Valley

Susan’s Country Bakery
will be set-up at

Western Rockcastle Water
 Parking Lot this Friday

Selling Baked Goods

Country Care
Day Care

Now Enrolling
256-KIDS (5437)

www.countrycaredaycare.com

Subscribe to the Signal


